STATES OF JERSEY

GOVERNMENT PLAN 2020-2023
(P.71/2019): SEVENTEENTH
AMENDMENT (P.71/2019 Amd.(17)) —
ADDENDUM

Presented to the States on 25th November 2019
by the Corporate Services Scrutiny Panel

STATES GREFFE

2019 P.71 Amd.(17)Add.



ADDENDUM

If P.71/2019 Amd.(17) (our amendment to P.71/2019 lodged on 12th November 2019)
were to be adopted by the States, the Minister for Treasury and Resources would need
to propose an amendment to the Draft Finance (2020 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201-
(P.109/2019) to give effect to this change in law.

The Minister can do this without notice, under Standing Order 80A. In order to assist
Members, we are publishing the draft amendment to P.109/2019 which the Minister
would propose in those circumstances, as an addendum to our Government Plan
amendment.

DRAFT FINANCE (2020 BUDGET) (JERSEY) LAW 201- (P.109/2019):
AMENDMENT

PAGE 29, ARTICLE 18 —
(1) For the text of Article 18 substitute —

“(1) In Article 92B(1) —

(@)  insub-paragraphs (c) and (d) for “£16,000” in each place there
is substituted “£16,500”;

(b) in sub-paragraph (¢) for “£6,150” there is substituted
“£6,350”.

(2) In Article 92B(5), in the definition “qualifying income” —
(@) for “Case I or IT” there is substituted “Case I, IT or ITA”;

(b) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£5,000” there is substituted
“£6,2507;

(¢) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£4,500” there is substituted
“£4,650”.”.

(2)  After Article 18 insert —

‘ “18A Article 95 (children) amended

‘ In Article 95(1) and (4), for “£3,000” in each place there is substituted
“£3,1007.

‘ 18B Article 98A (additional allowance in respect of children) amended
In Article 98A(1A) for “£4,500” there is substituted “£4,650”.”.

Page - 2
P.71/2019 Amd.(17)Add.


https://statesassembly.gov.je/assemblypropositions/2019/p.71-2019amd(17).pdf
https://statesassembly.gov.je/assemblypropositions/2019/p.71-2019.pdf
https://statesassembly.gov.je/assemblypropositions/2019/p.109-2019.pdf

