DRAFT BOATS AND SURF-RIDING (CONTROL)
(AMENDMENT No. 17) (JERSEY) REGULATIONS 199

Lodged au Greffe on 24th November 1998
by the Harbours and Airport Committee

STATES OF JERSEY

STATES GREFFE

175 1998 P.251

Price code: A



Explanatory Note
These Regulations would have the following effect -

(a) 1o increase the registration fee for a surf or sail board
from £3.00 to £3.50;

(b) to increase to £12.00 the fee payable for the registration
of a boat or a speedboat;

(¢c) to increase the fees payable for the inspection, for survey
purposes, of boats plying for hire, to £11.40 per half hour
(to the nearest half hour) for each person engaged on the
inspection;

(d) to increase the licence fee for a boat plying for hire
to £13.70.

The Regulations would come into effect on st January 1999.



3

Harbours (Administration) (Jersey) Law 1961

BOATS AND SURF-RIDING (CONTROL) (AMENDMENT No. 17)
(JERSEY) REGULATIONS 1998

(Promulgated on the day of 199 )

STATES OF JERSEY

The day of 199

THE STATES, in exercise of the powers conferred on them
by Article 4 of the Harbours (Administration) (Jersey) Law 1961,' as
amended, have made the following Regulations -

1. In paragraph (4) of Regulation 2 of the Boats and Surf-
Riding (Control) (Jersey) Regulations 1969, as amended’ (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Regulations™) for the words “three pounds”
there shall be substituted the words “three pounds fifty pence”.

2. In paragraph (2) of Regulation 3B of the principal
Regulations for the words “three pounds” there shall be substituted the
words “three pounds fifty pence”.

3. In paragraph (2) of Regulation 5 of the principal
Regulations for the words “eleven pounds and seventy pence” there
shall be substituted the words “twelve pounds”.

4. In sub-paragraph (a) of paragraph (2) of Regulation 10 of
the principal Regulations for the words “ten pounds ninety pence” there
shall be substituted the words “eleven pounds forty pence”.

" Recueil des Lois, Volume 1961-1962, page 165.
> No. 5239.
* Nos. 7268, 7688, 8144, 8312, 8604, 8674 and 9181.



4

5. In paragraph (2) of Regulation 11 of the principal
Regulations for the words “thirteen pounds ten pence” there shall be
substituted the words “thirteen pounds seventy pence”.

6. In paragraph (1) of Regulation 28 of the principal
Regulations for the words “eleven pounds and seventy pence” there
shall be substituted the words “twelve pounds”.

7. These Regulations may be cited as the Boats and Surf-
Riding (Control) (Amendment No. 17) (Jersey) Regulations 1998 and
shall come into force on the first day of January 1999,



