STATES OF JERSEY

=

DRAFT FINANCE (2016 BUDGET)
(JERSEY) LAW 201-

Lodged au Greffe on 20th October 2015
by the Minister for Treasury and Resources

STATES GREFFE

2015 Price code: D P.129






Jersey

DRAFT FINANCE (2016 BUDGET) (JERSEY)
LAW 201-

European Convention on Human Rights

In accordance with the provisions of Article 16tbé Human Rights (Jersey) Law
2000, the Minister for Treasury and Resources hedenthe following statement —

In the view of the Minister for Treasury and Res®s; the provisions of the Draft
Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- are cotnigatiith the Convention Rights.

Signed: Senator A.J.H. Maclean

Minister for Treasury and Resources

Dated: 19th October 2015

S%ates% Page -3
of Jersey P.129/2015



REPORT

This draft Law gives effect to proposals descrilvethe Draft Budget Statement 2016
(P.127/2015).

Financial and manpower implications

The financial and manpower implications are cleddgntified within the Draft
Budget Statement 2016.

Human Rights

The notes on the human rights aspects of the Heaitin the Appendix have been
prepared by the Law Officers’ Department and aruited for the information of
States Members. They are not, and should not les tag, legal advice.

Page - 4 S%ates%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



APPENDIX TO REPORT

Human Rights Notes on the Draft Finance (2016 Budge(Jersey) Law 201-

These Notes have been prepared in respect of th& Bmance (2016 Budget)
(Jersey) Law 201- (the “draft Law”) by the Law @ffrs’ Department. They
summarise the principal human rights issues arigog the contents of the draft Law
and explain why, in the Law Officers’ opinion, theaft Law is compatible with the
European Convention on Human Rights (‘ECHR").

These Notes are included for the information of Stes Members. They are not,
and should not be taken as, legal advice.

The only substantive issue in respect of humantgigh the retrospective effect of
Article 12. This amends Article 118B of the Incoiax (Jersey) Law 1961 in respect
of tax exemptions for non-residents in respectrefgrence shares.

A distinction in tax treatment has arisen due toctange of definition of
“distributions” from companies to share-owners. &inthe Income Tax (Amendment
No. 43) (Jersey) Law 2013, which took effect on Jamuary 2014, a dividend from
“preference shares” was no longer included as stridution” under the Income Tax
(Jersey) Law 1961. This change meant that seppratésion for preference shares
had to be made as regards the exemption legis|attotne reference to “distributions”
in Article 118(1)(b) would no longer include preface shares. Article 118B(1)(ba)
plugged this gap and took effect on 1st Januaryl 2Bat that provision itself created
an unintended distinction between the treatmentpraference shares and other
dividends — as Article 118(1)(ba) did not inclutie taveat restricting the exemption
where the dividend was paid out of taxed profity. I®moving this unintended
distinction retrospectively, the draft Law achievggalitatively the same balance
between the rights of taxpayers and the public megeas was achieved when
Article 38 of the Income Tax (Amendment No. 41)rédy) Law 2013 abolished a
similar unintended distinction between dividendsdpaut of Schedule A and D
income. That earlier provision was passed as Haimgan rights compliant, and there
are no reasons to justify seeing this legislat®being any different.

States % Page -3
of Jersey P.129/2015



Explanatory Note

Part 1 amends the Income Tax (Jersey) Law 1961 (the “1964"). Except where
express provision is made to the contrary, the a@memts commence on
1st January 2016 and, if relevant to a year of saesent, have effect for 2016
onwards.

Interpretation and standard rate of income tax

Article 1 provides for the interpretation Bfart 1
Avrticle 2 sets the standard rate of income tax, for 201B0%.

Allowances and reliefs

Article 3 amends Article 65B of the 1961 Law. The deducatlowed each year to a
taxpayer in respect of his or her total assesshéiefits in kind is reduced from
£1,000 to £250.

Articles 4 and Gare concerned with the marginal income deductilonvad in respect
of interest payments on a person’s only or maindesse. There are, currently,
2 restrictions on the interest eligible for reli€he interest can only relate to a loan or
loans not exceeding £300,000. Of that interesy 646,000 per annum is eligible for
relief. Article 4 reduces the cap on the amount of interest theigible for relief, year
by year, from 2017 until 2025. In 202@rticle 5 repeals the marginal income
deduction for interest payments.

Article 6 increases the basic exemption threshold allowedspect of persons who
are under the age of 65.

Articles 7 and 8amend Articles 92A, 95 and 98A of the 1961 Law arding
eligibility for child allowance under Article 95 irespect of a child under the age of 16
or at school, and the additional allowance undeicker98A. Currently, if a person is
entitled to a deduction under Article 95 or 98A¢ therson’s exemption threshold is
increased by the same amount. In 2016 the dedueiibbe reduced be one-third. In
2017 it will be reduced by a further one-third. /ar®2018 the deduction will be
removed. However, this phasing out of the deductioas not affect the amount by
which a person’s exemption threshold is increadetheé person is entitled under
Article 95 and 98A. Accordingly, Articles 95 and A&re amended so as to set
different amounts for the exemption threshold inaseeand the deduction to which a
person is entitled under those Articles, presenviihg exemption threshold and
reducing, and then removing, the deduction. Thesendments do not affect the
exemption threshold increase and deduction allowag@spect of a child aged 17 or
more and in full-time higher education (Article @Kp) of the 1961 Law).
Consequential amendments are made to Articles 80B2aB of the 1961 Law.

Article 9 amends Article 92A of the 1961 Law. From 1stJayp@817, the
amendment restricts eligibility to the age enhareezimption threshold to individuals
who are aged 65 or more on 31st December 2016.

Article 10revises the rule for increasing the tax exemptioeshold to take account
of a wife’'s or civil partner's earned income. Cuntg, where a husband’s total
income includes that of his wife, his exemptioregiirold is increased by the amount
of her income, subject to a cap of £4,500, irrespeof whether the husband is also

Page - 6 S%ates%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



in receipt of earned income. The same rule appliesvil partners. The amendment
has the effect that the increase in the exemplticeshold will only apply where both

spouses or civil partners are in receipt of eainedme. As now, any income paid
from one spouse or civil partner to another isedjarded for the purposes of the rule.
The amount of the increase in the threshold willde&ermined by reference to the
earned income of whichever of the spouses or piaitnhers has the lower income,
subject, as now, to a cap of £4,500.

Article 11 amends the maximum exemption threshold incredeseved for child day
care in respect of a child who is under 4 or a#tdirat age in the year of assessment.
The maximum is increased from £12,000 to £14,000.

Article 12is also concerned with the exemption thresholdeimse for child day care.
The rule for eligibility for the increase is revisgo that, if the claimant is a spouse or
civil partner, both the claimant and his or her ugm or civil partner must have
qualifying income, unless one of them is totallgdpacitated throughout the year. The
rule that made a man ineligible for the increadeeiflived with a woman as husband
and wife is removed.

Article 13is concerned with the taxation of an individualoat not resident in Jersey.

Paragraphs (1) and (3lter the rules for giving allowances and reltefs. non-
resident. Currently, such an individual is entittechllowances and reliefs under
Part 12 of the 1961 Law, although the total amaiinbe allowances and reliefs
given is restricted by Article 106 of that Law. Asbstituted, Article 106 will
have the effect that a non-resident will only bétkenl to allowances and reliefs
under Part 12 for a year of assessment if he orhalein that year, income
arising from a trade, profession or employment e@sed in Jersey and therefore
taxable under Schedule D. The cap on allowanceseadieds that was formerly
in Article 106 is removed, but Article 129A of ti®61 Law, as amended, will
apply so that the amount of allowances and re@iefsn is pro-rated, according
to the portion of the year for which the individisin Jersey.

Paragraph (2) amends Article 118B of the 1961 Law, which exempts-
residents from income tax on certain income. Therament has the effect
that, if a non-resident receives a dividend fromiclwhtax is deducted, in
accordance with Article 88 of the 1961 Law, atithie of 10%, the non-resident
has no further liability to tax on the dividend.

Distributions by companies

Article 14makes amendments associated with preference shares

Paragraph (1)amends Article 62 of the 1961 Law so as to rethgescope of
taxation under Case Ill of Schedule D. Currently,davidends on preference
shares declared by a company regarded as resiudarsey are taxed under
Case lli(g). The amendment limits the applicatioh Gase lli(g) to such
dividends as are declared out of profits or gagxed at a rate other than 20%.
The consequence is that such dividends as arereéatat of profits or gains
taxed at 20% are brought within the definition tdisution” in Article 3AE of
the 1961 Law. Distributions received by an indiatiuare taxable under
Case IX or Case llI(f).

Paragraph (2)amends Article 118B of the 1961 Law so that exémnpfrom
tax is only allowed to a non-resident in respectaotlividend declared on
preference shares of a company regarded as regidéeitsey if the dividend is

States % Page -7
of Jersey P.129/2015



paid out of profits or gains of the company th& &xed on the company at the
rate of 0%. It is proposed that this amendmenttici® 118B is backdated to
year of assessment 2014. The transitional proviaduted to Schedule 5 ensures
that claims for exemption from tax that have algediten made under
Article 118B before the day this Law is lodged atef® (when this Article
would be deemed to have come into force) are rietid by the backdating of
the amendment to year of assessment 2014.

Article 15 amends Article 62 of and Schedule 5 to the 1964 ka as to bring into
taxation income arising from dividends of a compangorporated outside Jersey
which are paid out of capital.

Article 16is concerned with shareholder loans. The amousuoh loans made in a

year to a shareholder or a member of his or heilffaon household, net of any

repayments of such loans made in the same yedaxé&l on the recipient under
Case VIII of Schedule D. Currently, a recipienteistitled to a deduction of up to

£1,000 each year, reducing the amount broughttextoThe amendment removes the
right to a deduction.

Article 17amends Articles 88 and 133 of the 1961 Law.

Paragraph (1)amends Article 88. Article 88 provides that anitgrdeclaring a
dividend may deduct tax at the rate at which thityeiiself is taxed on the
profits or gains out of which the dividend is deeth Article 88 then provides
that certain recipients of the dividend are erditie a tax credit for the amount
deducted. Currently, a recipient entitled to a yepent of management
expenses under Article 133 of the 1961 Law is lextito a credit that is capped
by reference to the amount of the expenses of nemnegt. Article 88 is
amended to remove the entitlement to a creditdoh s recipient. Article 88 is
further amended to revise the rule for calculatimg credit where the recipient
of a dividend is a company taxed at 10%.

Paragraph (2)amends Article 133. Article 133 entitles an inwestt holding
company to a refund of tax paid by the company ihaqual to the amount of
tax paid on money paid out as expenses of manadgeiftem amendment has
the effect that the entitlement to a refund dodsapply to tax deducted, under
Article 88, from a dividend paid to the company.

It is proposed that these amendments should applividends paid on or after
the day this draft Law is lodged au Greffe.

Companies

Article 18 narrows the descriptions of companies incorporatedersey that are

regarded as resident in Jersey. Currently, a Jersgyporated company that is
managed and controlled in another jurisdictionides® for tax purposes there, and in
which any company may be taxed at a highest ratevobf 20% or higher, is not

regarded as resident in Jersey. The amendmente®gdie tax rate limit to 10% or

higher. Consequently, Jersey incorporated compdin&sare managed and controlled
in another jurisdiction where the highest rate af applicable to any company has
been reduced below 20% but remains 10% or highkrcamtinue to be regarded as
not resident in Jersey.

Pensions

Article 19amends Article 62 and Part 19 of, and Scheduléolfhe 1961 Law. These
amendments affect the taxation of pensions andqesshemes.

Page - 8 S%ates%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



The amendment made Iparagraph (1)clarifies the scope of taxation under
Case lll of Schedule D. The amendment specifiesathg lump sum paid from
a pension scheme or similar arrangement is taxddruhat Case, irrespective
of the reason for the payment.

The amendments made pgragraph (2)add 2 circumstances in which benefits
are deemed to have commenced from a pension schdradirst is that the
pension holder has attained the age of 75 (the ggevhich payments of
pension income from an approved Jersey schemeaooshence). The second
is that the pension holder has transferred funtistire scheme from a scheme
established outside Jersey in which benefits hiready commenced. Whether
or not benefits have commenced from a pension setefacts the taxation of
lump sums paid from the scheme — see Article 13the1961 Law.

The amendments made pgragraphs (3)(a) and (4) to (&)arify the provision
that an approved Jersey scheme may include fopdéyenent, following the
death of a pension holder, of a pension to a degr@ntf a person only qualifies
as a dependant of the pension holder by reasorinfylihe pension holder’s
child and under the age of 23 when the pensionehalies, the scheme must
provide for pension payments to cease upon th@persaining that age.

The amendments made Iparagraphs (3)(b), (8) and (113llow a payment
(other than a return of contributions) to be madeaf a Jersey occupational
pension scheme to the employer, in exceptionalugistances, such as the
winding up of the scheme, and if the Comptrolleprapes. There is a right to
appeal if the Comptroller does not approve the maymrhe payment is taxed
as a receipt of the employer’s trade, professiorooation.

Paragraph (7)provides that, when a scheme manager notifieCtimaptroller
of a transfer into an approved Jersey scheme froothar scheme, the scheme
manager must inform the Comptroller whether besdfdve commenced from
the scheme from which the transfer is made. Thisraiment is associated with
the amendment made bgragraph (2).

Paragraph (9)makes it clear that, subject to existing exempgti@my lump sum
paid from an approved Jersey scheme is taxed at it@¥spective of whether
the lump sum is paid by way of commutation or foy ather reason. This
amendment is associated with the amendment magarbgraph (1).

Paragraph (10) makes it clear that any transfer that is permitsd the
1961 Law of fund value out of an approved Jerségs®e to another approved
Jersey scheme or approved drawdown contract omtecaivalent scheme
established outside Jersey is exempt from tax.

Paragraph (12) provides that the amendments have effect for thar yof
assessment 2016 onwards.

Collection and administration

Article 20 amends Article 13 of the 1961 Law. Article 13 altg permits the
disclosure of statistical information to the Mimistfor Treasury and Resources, the
Chief Minister, and officers in their departmerfts, the purpose of estimating States
revenue or any other purpose affecting the reverfitiee States. The amendment has
the effect that any information may be disclosedffmers for those purposes.

States % Page -9
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 21 amends Article 17A of the 1961 Law so as to allawcompany an
additional 5 months in which to deliver a statemexgiuired under Article 16 of the
1961 Law.

Article 22revises the arrangements for the adjustment efsop’s liability to tax in a
case where a person who has been given an exentipteshold increase, allowance,
relief or deduction subsequently agrees to apporttowith another and, as a
consequence, the person’s tax liability has beedemassessed. Currently, the
1961 Law provides for the resultant underpaymeraxfto be assessed and recovered
under Case VI of Schedule D (as if the amount vpeodits or gains). This Article,
combined with the amendment made Asticle 7(2)(g) has the effect that the
underpayment will instead be recovered throughsige of a revised assessment. The
amendment made bprticle 7(3)(g) makes it clear that an agreement about the
apportionment of additional child allowance undetidde 98A of the 1961 Law may
be made after an exemption threshold increase addction has been allowed to a
person.

Article 23 revises the right for an employee to elect to mBAKE payments at an
effective rate, or a combined effective rate, #vateeds the rate that would otherwise
apply in his or her case. An employee will no lange required to make an election
in writing. Further, the cap on the maximum ratat tthe employee may ask to pay is
removed. The employee has a right of appeal itwaptroller does not agree the rate
proposed in the employee’s election. Spouses arnldpartners also have a right to
elect for the ITIS or combined effective rate apglto both of them to be adjusted so
that one pays at a higher rate and one pays atex late. The opportunity is taken to
make it clear that there is a right of appeal & @omptroller does not agree the rates
proposed.

Part 2 amends the Stamp Duties and Fees (Jersey) Law (1981998 Law”) and
the Taxation (Land Transactions) (Jersey) Law 2889 “2009 Law”).

Article 24 provides for the interpretation Bart 2

Article 25amends, in the 1998 Law and 2009 Law respectithby/ rules for the rate
of stamp duty or land transaction tax (“LTT") pal@alon a loan secured against a
residential property. The discounted rate is retgtti to property below a specified
value. The amendment increases this value thrednoid £400,000 to £450,000.
Currently, stamp duty or LTT is not payable on anlocof £300,000 or less. The
amendment increases this exemption threshold t0,888. As a consequence of this
increase in the exemption and discount availableegpect of all loans secured on
residential property, the separate exemption asdodnted rate for first time buyer
loans is abolished. These amendments do not dffectlief from stamp duty or LTT
allowed to a first time buyer in respect of theghase of a property.

Part 3amends the Customs and Excise (Jersey) Law 18891999 Law").
Article 26 provides for the interpretation Bart 3.

Article 27 amends definitions in the 1999 Law. Firstly, thefimgon “small
independent cider-maker” is amended so that theimam amount of cider that a
maker may produce per year and still fall withire ttefinition is increased from
20,000 litres to 500,000. Secondly, the definitiemall independent distiller of
spirits” is substituted. Currently, an independeistiller falls within the definition if
the distiller does not distil more than 2,000 kti&f alcohol per year. The substituted
definition has the effect that an independent ltstfalls within the definition for a
year if the distiller has not distilled more thad,d00 litres of alcohol in total during
the preceding 5 years.

Page - 10 S%ates%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Article 28increases excise duty, other than vehicle emissioty.
Paragraph (a)increases duty on spirits.
Paragraph (b)increases duty on wines.

Paragraph (c)increases duty on beer produced by a small indkgrerbrewer,
except that the rate for beer exceeding 1.2% volbuatenot exceeding 2.8%
volume remains unchanged.

Paragraph (d) increases duty on all other beer. Again, the faie beer
exceeding 1.2% volume but not exceeding 2.8% volten&ins unchanged.

Paragraph (e)increases duty on cider produced by a small inoldget cider-
maker, except that the rate for cider exceedingolv@dlume but not exceeding
2.8% volume remains unchanged.

Paragraph (f) increases duty on all other cider. Again, the rbte cider
exceeding 1.2% volume but not exceeding 2.8% volten&ins unchanged.

Paragraph (g)increases duty on other alcoholic beverages.
Paragraph (h)increases duty on tobacco.

Paragraph (i)increases duty on hydrocarbon oil.

Article 29 revises the rates for vehicle emissions duty (VipByable when a motor
vehicle is required to be registered under the M&tehicle Registration (Jersey)
Law 1993. Every motor vehicle that has an estabiSBQ mass emission figure will
be subject to VED at a rate determined accordinthab figure. Any motor vehicle
that does not have an established. @@ss emission figure will be subject to VED at
a rate determined according to its engine capagityehicle’s CQ mass emission
figure or engine capacity is recorded in the doaqumteon that must be produced in
order to register the vehicle. There will no londer a discounted rate of VED
applicable to a motor vehicle that, prior to itgistration in Jersey, was registered in
another jurisdiction a year or more before.

Part 4 contains provision for the citation and commenaetnoé this Law.

States % Page - 11
of Jersey P.129/2015






Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Ageanent

Jersey

DRAFT FINANCE (2016 BUDGET) (JERSEY)

LAW 201-
Arrangement
Article
PART 1 15
STANDARD RATE OF INCOME TAX SET FOR 2016 AND 15
INCOME TAX (JERSEY) LAW 1961 AMENDED 15
Interpretation and standard rate of income tax 15
1 Interpretation Of Part 1 ...........oovvvviiicecemmeeeeiiiss s 15
2 Standard rate of income tax for 2016 ...........cooviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiis 15
Allowances and reliefs 16
3 Benefits in kind — Article 65B amended ......ccccceeveveieiiiiiiiiiiiiieeee 16
4 Deduction for interest payments on only or maimndesce reduced
from 2017 — Article 90AA amended...........uceecceneniiiieeeeee e 16
5 Deduction for interest payments on only or maindesce withdrawn
in 2026 — Article 90AA repealed and Articles 90ARA, 92C and
RS 3 =T T T L= o 16
6 Basic exemption threshold — Article 92A amended...........ccccceeeeeeieennn. 17
7 Child allowance in 2016 and 2017 — Articles 90BA992B, 95 and
18 1S = 0 1= o = o N 17
8 Child allowance in 2018 — Articles 95 and 98A amehd.......................... 20
9 Age enhanced exemption threshold closed from 20Aftiele 92A
AMENAEA ... s e e e nnee 21
10 Earned income allowance for spouse or civil partharticle 92A
=10 1T 0o [= o [P O P PEP U PP PPPPRUPPPN 22
11 Exemption threshold increase for child day careticke 92B
AMENAEA ... i e e e nnee 23
12 Eligibility for exemption threshold increase forilchday care —
Article 92B amended.............ouviiiiiiiii e 23
13 Non-residents — Article 106 substituted and Arscld8B and 129A
AMENAEA ... i e e e nnne 24
Distributions by companies 25
14 Preference shares — Articles 62 and 118B and SEh&camended ............ 25
15 Income arising from possessions out of Jersey iel&62 and
Schedule 5 amended...........couiiiiiiis o et 25
16 Shareholder loans — Article 810 and Schedule 5 deekn..............ccc....... 26
17 Dividends and distributions — Articles 88 and 183aded........................ 26
States & Page - 13
of Jersey

P.129/2015



Arrangement Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jerseyy P@1-

Companies 27
18 Companies regarded as resident in Jersey — AfitR3eamended................ 27
Pensions 27
19 Pensions — Article 62, Part 19 and Schedule 1A deen........................ 27
Collection and administration 29
20 Disclosure of information — Article 13 amended............ccccceveeeeiiiiinnee. 29
21 Time for delivery of company statement — ArticleAldmended................. 30
22 Revised assessment following apportionment — Asi@4 and 92A
=T 1T 0o [= o [P P PP PPUPURPPPN 30
23 ITIS rate — Articles 41C, 41D, 41DA and 49B amendad
Schedule 1A reVISEA .....ccooiiiiii i 30
PART 2 31
STAMP DUTIES AND FEES (JERSEY) LAW 1998 AND TAXATI®
(LAND TRANSACTIONS) (JERSEY) LAW 2009 AMENDED 31
24 Interpretation Of Part 2............ueieeeiie e 31
25 Schedules to 1998 Law and 2009 Law amended — skdetss and
security interests on residential Property ..ccccee..ooooviiciriieeeeeeeeneneeeee 32
PART 3 32
CUSTOMS AND EXCISE (JERSEY) LAW 1999 AMENDED 32
26 Interpretation Of Part 3............uuuiuiiimmmmme e aae e 32
27 Small independent cider-makers and distillers aftsp- Article 1
=T 1T 0o [= o [ TP P PP PPUPURPPP 33
28 Excise duty (other than vehicle emissions dutypst P of Schedule 1
=Yg 0= o o = o 33
29 Vehicle emissions duty — Part 2 of Schedule 1 aménd.......................... 34
PART 4 36
CLOSING 36
30 Citation and COMMENCEMENT ... ..o 36
Page - 14 States &

P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Aatic

Jersey

DRAFT FINANCE (2016 BUDGET) (JERSEY)
LAW 201-

A LAW to set the standard rate of income tax for 2016 mnamend the
Income Tax (Jersey) Law 1961, the Stamp DutiesFaes (Jersey) Law 1998,
the Taxation (Land Transactions) (Jersey) Law 2608 the Customs and
Excise (Jersey) Law 1999

Adopted by the States [date to be inserted]
Sanctioned by Order of Her Majesty in Council [daddbe inserted]
Registered by the Royal Court [date to be inserted]

THE STATES, subject to the sanction of Her Most Excellent &4ay in
Council, have adopted the following Law —

PART 1

STANDARD RATE OF INCOME TAX SET FOR 2016 AND
INCOME TAX (JERSEY) LAW 1961 AMENDED

Interpretation and standard rate of income tax

1 Interpretation of Part 1

In this Part, except where the context otherwisguires, a reference to an
Article or Schedule is to the Article or Schedufetteat number in the Income
Tax (Jersey) Law 1961

2 Standard rate of income tax for 2016

There shall be levied and charged in Jersey forytar 2016, in accordance
with and subject to the provisions of the Incomex {aersey) Law 1961
income tax at the standard rate of 20 pence ipoload.

s%ates% Page - 15
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 3 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2 -

Allowances and reliefs

3 Benefits in kind — Article 65B amended

(1) In Article 65B(3) for the amount “£1,000” theshall be substituted the
amount “£250".

(2) This Article shall have effect for the yearasfsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

4 Deduction for interest payments on only or mainesidence reduced from
2017 — Article 90AA amended

(1) For Article 90AA(5)(b) there shall be substidtthe following sub-
paragraph and table —

“(b) that portion of the total interest payablettd@es not exceed the
limit specified, for the year of assessment, inThble.

Table
Year of assessment Limit on amount of interest
2016 £15,000
2017 £13,500
2018 £12,000
2019 £10,500
2020 £9,000
2021 £7,500
2022 £6,000
2023 £4,500
2024 £3,000
2025 £1,500.".

(2) This Article shall have effect for the yearasfsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

5 Deduction for interest payments on only or mainesidence withdrawn in
2026 — Article 90AA repealed and Articles 90AE, 92292C and 1311
amended

(1) Article 90AA shall be repealed.

(2) In Article 90AE —

(@) in the heading and in paragraphs (1), (2) &)dfor the words
“Articles 90AA to 90AD” there shall be substitutdle words
“Articles 90AB to 90AD”;

Page - 16 S%ateS%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Aete

(b) paragraphs (3A) and (4) shall be deleted.

(3) In Article 92A(10) for the words “Article 90AA90B or 90C” there shall
be substituted the words “Article 90B or 90C".

(4) In Article 92C(2) for the words “Article 90AA0B or 90C” there shall
be substituted the words “Article 90B or 90C".

(5) In Article 131I(3) for the definition “incomethere shall be substituted
the following definition —

“‘income’ means the pension holder’s total incofoe a year of

assessment, before the deduction of the total apgrgpension

contributions paid by the pension holder in thery&aassessment
(whether or not allowed as a deduction under pag@y(2)).”.

(6) This Article shall come into force on 1st Jary2026 and have effect for
the year of assessment 2026 and ensuing years.

6 Basic exemption threshold — Article 92A amended

(1) In Article 92A —
(& in paragraphs (2)(ii) and (2A)(ii) for the anmbu'£22,800" there
shall be substituted the amount “£23,000";

(b) in paragraph (6)(b) for the amount “£14,200eréh shall be
substituted the amount “£14,350".

(2) This Article shall have effect for the yearasfsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

7 Child allowance in 2016 and 2017 — Articles 90B2A, 92B, 95 and 98A
amended

(1) In Article 90B(1)(a)(ii)(B) for the words “a dection under Article 95,”
there shall be substituted the words “an exemptioashold increase
under Article 95,".

(2) In Article 92A —

(@) for paragraph (8) there shall be substitute@ tlollowing
paragraph —

“(8) The threshold applicable in an individual’sseashall be increased
by —
(@) the amount of any such increase to which tlevitual is
entitled under Article 95; and

(b) an additional amount, if the individual is ¢l to such an
increase under Article 95(1)(b) (having regard to
Article 95(3)), including if the individual is emfiéd to an
increase under Article 95(1)(b) by virtue of Ard5(2).”;

(b) for paragraph (9) there shall be substitutea tfollowing
paragraph —

s%ates% Page - 17
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 7 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2\ -

“(9) The threshold applicable in an individual’'sseashall be increased
by the amount of any such increase to which theviedal is
entitled under Article 98A.".

(3) In Article 92B(5) in the definition “qualifyinghild” for the words “a
deduction under Article 95" there shall be subsgituthe words “an
exemption threshold increase under Article 95”.

(4) In Article 95 —

(@) in paragraph (1)(a) for the words “be entitladrespect of each
child to a deduction of £3,000; or” there shall dadstituted the
words —

“be entitled in respect of each child to —

() an increase in his or her exemption threshofd o
£3,000, and

(i) adeduction of —
(A) for the year of assessment 2016, £2,000,
(B) for the year of assessment 2017, £1,000; or”;

(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for the words “be entitiedrespect of each
child to a deduction of £6,000.” there shall be sditbted the
words —

“be entitled in respect of each child to —

() an increase in his or her exemption threshold o
£6,000, and

(i) adeduction of £6,000.";
(c) in paragraph (2) —
() for the words “a deduction” there shall be gitbhted the
words “an exemption threshold increase and deduigtio

(i)  for the words “such a deduction,” there shadl substituted
the words “such an increase and deduction,”,

(i)  for the words “the same deduction” there $h substituted
the words “the same exemption threshold increasg an
deduction”;

(d) for paragraph (3) there shall be substitutecd tfollowing
paragraph —

“(3) Inthe case of a child who is entitled in ttiald’s own right to an
income exceeding £3,000 a year, the exemptiontblésncrease
and deduction under this Article in respect of ¢hidd shall each
be reduced —

(@ in the case of an increase and a deduction runde
paragraph (1)(a), by the amount of the excess; and

(b) in the case of an increase and deduction under
paragraph (1)(b), by £3 for every £2 of the excess.

(e) in paragraph (4) —

(i) for the words “a deduction” there shall be dubted the
words “an exemption threshold increase and deduGtio

Page - 18 S%ateS%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Aatic

(i)  for the words “the deduction” there shall bebstituted the
words “the increase and deduction”;

(f) after paragraph (4) there shall be inserted tf@lowing
paragraph —

“(4A) The exemption threshold increase and deduoctimust be
apportioned in the same proportion.”;

(g) for paragraph (5) there shall be substitutecd tfollowing
paragraph —

“(5) An apportionment may be made under paragrédph (
notwithstanding that an exemption threshold inaeaasnd
deduction in respect of the child in question haweady been
allowed to any individual.”.

(5) In Article 98A —

(@) in paragraph (1) —

(i) for the words “a deduction under Article 95"etle shall be
substituted the words “an exemption threshold iasee
under Article 957,

(i)  for the words “the individual shall, subjed paragraphs (2)
to (5), be entitled to a deduction of £4,500.” thehall be
substituted the words “the individual shall be #ad as
described in paragraph (1A).”;

(b) after paragraph (1) there shall be inserted flolowing
paragraph —

| “(1A) Subject to paragraphs (2) to (5), the induatishall be entitled to —
(@) anincrease in his or her exemption threshbi#@b00; and
(b) adeduction of —
)] for the year of assessment 2016, £3,000,
(i)  for the year of assessment 2017, £1,500.";

(c) in paragraph (2) for the words “one deductidh&ére shall be
substituted the words “one exemption thresholdeiase and one
deduction”;

(d) in paragraph (3) —

(i) in sub-paragraph (b) for the words “a deductiander
paragraph (1),” there shall be substituted the wofan
exemption threshold increase and a deduction under
paragraph (1A),”,

(i)  for the words beginning “neither of them” tbet end of the
paragraph there shall be substituted the wordstHeeiof
them shall be entitled to such an increase and atietu
except in respect of the youngest of the childrerespect of
whom either would be entitted to an increase and
deduction.”;

(e) in sub-paragraph (3A) —

() in sub-paragraph (b) for the words “a deductionder
paragraph (1),” there shall be substituted the watah

States & Page - 19
of Jersey

P.129/2015



Article 8

Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2\ -

(f)

()]

(4B)

(h)

“(5)

exemption threshold increase and a deduction under
paragraph (1A),”,

(i)  for the words beginning “neither of them” tbet end of the
paragraph there shall be substituted the wordstHeeiof
them shall be entitled to such an increase and atiedu
except in respect of the youngest of the childrerespect of
whom either would be entitled to an increase and
deduction.”;

in paragraph (4) for the words “the deductiorder paragraph (1)”
there shall be substituted the words “the incremse deduction
under paragraph (1A)";

after paragraph (4) there shall be inserted flolowing
paragraphs —

“(4A) The exemption threshold increase and dedaoctimust be

apportioned under paragraph (4) in the same prioport

An apportionment may be made under paragréph (
notwithstanding that an exemption threshold inaeasnd
deduction in respect of the child in question hasaaly been
allowed to any individual.”;

for paragraph (5) there shall be substitutea tfollowing
paragraph —

Where for any year of assessment an individsiantitled under
this Article to apportioned amounts in respect ofo2 more
children —

(@) the exemption threshold increase to which titgvidual is
entitled shall be equal to the sum of those amoumtshe
amount referred to in paragraph (1A)(a), whicheigethe
lesser;

(b) the deduction to which the individual is emtitl shall be
equal to the sum of those amounts or the amouetresf to
in paragraph (1A)(b) for the year of assessmentchaver
is the lesser.”.

(6) This Article shall have effect for the yearasfsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

8 Child allowance in 2018 — Articles 95 and 98A ameéed
(1) In Article 95 —

@

(b)

(©)

in paragraph (1)(a) for the words beginning &ngitled in respect
of each child” to the end of the sub-paragraph ethghall be
substituted the words “be entitled in respect afheeahild to an
increase in his or her exemption threshold of £3,00";

in paragraphs (2), (4), (4A) and (5) after therd “deduction”, in
each place that it appears, there shall be inséhdvords “(if

any)”;

for paragraph (3) there shall be substitute@ tfollowing

paragraph —

Page - 20

Y=
States &

P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Acti

“(3) Inthe case of a child who is entitled in ttiald’s own right to an
income exceeding £3,000 a year —

(@) the exemption threshold increase under paradigfa)
shall be reduced by the amount of the excess;

(b) the exemption threshold increase and deductioder
paragraph (1)(b) shall each be reduced by £3 feryef2 of
the excess.”.

(2) In Article 98A —
(a) for paragraph (1A) there shall be substitutés tfollowing
paragraph —
“(1A) Subject to paragraphs (2) to (5), the induadl shall be entitled to
an increase in his or her exemption threshold ¢5@aL";
(b) in paragraph (2) the words “and one deductsivdll be deleted;
(c) inparagraph (3) —

() in sub-paragraph (b) the words “and a deduétisimall be

deleted,

(i) the words “and deduction”, in each place ttzy appear,
shall be deleted;

(d) in paragraph (3A) —
(i) in sub-paragraph (b) the words “and a deduétsimall be
deleted,

(i) the words “and deduction”, in each place thzy appear,
shall be deleted:;

(e) in paragraph (4) the words “and deduction” Idheldeleted;

(f)  paragraph (4A) shall be deleted;

(@) in paragraph (4B) the words “and deduction’lisbe deleted,;

(h) for paragraph (5) there shall be substitutecd tfollowing
paragraph —

“(5) Where for any year of assessment an individsantitled under
this Article to apportioned amounts in respect ofo2 more
children, the exemption threshold increase to wiighindividual
is entitled shall be equal to the sum of those artmuor the
amount referred to in paragraph (1A), whichevehéslesser.”.

(3) This Article shall come into force on 1st Jaryu2018 and have effect for
the year of assessment 2018 and ensuing years.

9 Age enhanced exemption threshold closed from 20%7Article 92A
amended

(1) In Article 92A —
(a) paragraph (Al) shall be deleted;

(b) in paragraph (2)(i) for the words “at the conmoement of the year
of assessment, either he or his wife was the reteage or older,”

States % Page - 21
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 10 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2l -

there shall be substituted the words “on 31st Déezrf016,
either he or his wife was aged 65 or older,”;

(c) in paragraph (2A)(i) for the words “at the coemement of the
year of assessment, either he or she, or his ociigmpartner B
was the relevant age or older,” there shall betgubed the words
“on 31st December 2016, either he or she, or hishar civil
partner B, was aged 65 or older,”;

(d) in paragraph (6) for the words “at the commeneet of the year
of assessment, he or she was the relevant ageer dhere shall
be substituted the words “on 31st December 201&rhehe was
aged 65 or older,”.

(2) This Article shall come into force on 1st Jary2017 and have effect for
the year of assessment 2017 and ensuing years.

10 Earned income allowance for spouse or civil paner — Article 92A
amended

(1) In Article 92A —

(& in paragraph (2A) for the words “paragraphs)(446A), (8)
and (9)” there shall be substituted the words “geaphs (4A), (5),
(8) and (9)";

(b) for paragraphs (4), (4A), (5) and (5A) theralkbe substituted the
following paragraphs —

“(4) Where —

(@) anindividual to whom paragraph (2) applieeiees earned
income for a year of assessment; and

(b) the individual's wife also receives earned imeofor the
year of assessment, which is included in the iotadme of
the individual,

the threshold applicable in the individual’s caballsbe increased
by whichever is the lowest of —

(i) £4,500;
(i)  an amount equal to his earned income; or
(i) an amount equal to his wife’'s earned income.

(4A) Where —

(@) an individual to whom paragraph (2A) appliexerees
earned income for a year of assessment; and
(b) the individual's civil partner B also receivearned income

for the year of assessment, which is included & tital
income of the individual,

the threshold applicable in the individual’s caballsbe increased
by whichever is the lowest of —

(i) £4,500;
(i) an amount equal to his or her earned income; o
(i) an amount equal to civil partner B’s earnadome.

Page - 22 S%ateS%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Aeticl

(5) For the purposes of paragraphs (4) and (4A&yned income’ shall
not include earned income received or receivablarbyndividual
from his or her spouse or civil partner.”.

(2) This Article shall have effect for the yearassessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

11  Exemption threshold increase for child day care Article 92B amended

(1) In Article 92B(1)(c) and (d) for the amount ‘£D00” there shall be
substituted the amount “£14,000".

(2) This Article shall have effect for the yearasfsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

12  Eligibility for exemption threshold increase forchild day care — Article 92B

amended
(1) For Article 92B(1)(b) there shall be substitut¢he following sub-
paragraphs —

“(b) in the case of a claimant who is an eligiblaimant by
virtue of sub-paragraph (a) of the definition ‘dhig
claimant’ in paragraph (5), whichever is the lower

(i) the claimant’s qualifying income, and
(i)  the qualifying income of the claimant’s spousecivil
partner;

(ba) in the case of a claimant who is an eligibl@incant by
virtue of sub-paragraph (c) of the definition ‘dtilp
claimant in paragraph (5), the claimant's qualifyi
income;”.

(2) In Article 92B(5) for the definition “eligibleclaimant” there shall be
substituted the following definition —

“ ‘eligible claimant’ means —

(@) anindividual —
() in whose case the exemption threshold described

Article 92A(2) or (2A) applies,

(i)  who has qualifying income, and
(i) whose spouse or civil partner has qualifyingome;

| ) anindividual -

() in whose case the exemption threshold described
Article 92A(2) or (2A) applies, and

(i)  who is entitled to an additional allowance end
Article 98A; or

(c) an individual in whose case the exemption thoks
described in Article 92A(6) applies and who haslifyiag
income;”.

States % Page - 23
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 13 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2t -

(3) In Article 92B(5) for the definition “qualifyig income” there shall be
substituted the following definition —

“‘qualifying income’ means income arising from aade,

profession, office, employment or vocation chardgeab tax under

Case |l or Il of Schedule D or under Schedule A gam$ to

Article 51(1)(b) or (c), excluding —

(@) the first £4,500 of such income for the yeams$essment;
and

(b) in the case of an individual who is marriediora civil
partnership, earned income received or receivakldhb
individual from his or her spouse or civil partrier;

(4) This Article shall have effect for the yearassessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

13 Non-residents — Article 106 substituted and Artles 118B and 129A
amended

(1) For Article 106 there shall be substitutedftiiowing Article —

“106 Non-residents

(1) Anindividual who is not resident in Jerseylsbaly be entitled to
allowances and reliefs under this Part for a ydaassessment if
the individual has profits or gains arising or adeg that are
charged to tax for the year of assessment undey IGasCase li(a)
or (b) of Schedule D.

(2) Such allowances and reliefs shall only be giiremespect of the
individual's profits or gains described in paradrd).

(3) Article 129A provides for the apportionment afowances and
reliefs in the case of an individual who is notJersey for the
whole year.”.

(2)  After Article 118B(1) there shall be insertée following paragraph —

“(1A) A person who is not resident in Jersey andwhpaid a dividend
from which tax is deducted at the rate of 10% unfikticle 88(3)
shall be exempt from the balance of tax that woalpdrt from this
paragraph, be due in respect of the dividend.”.

(3) In Article 129A —

(& in paragraph (1) the words “Subject to paragi@p,” shall be
deleted;

(b) paragraphs (2) and (4) shall be deleted.

(4) This Article shall have effect for the yearadsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

Page - 24 S%ateS%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Aatith

Distributions by companies

14 Preference shares — Articles 62 and 118B and ®clule 5 amended

(1)

)

®3)

“19

(4)

®)

(6)

In Article 62(1) at the end of Case lli(g) teeshall be added the words
“that are declared out of profits or gains charf¢eaio tax on the
company at a rate other than the standard rate;”.

At the end of Article 118B(1)(ba) there shadl &added the words “to the
extent that such dividends were declared out ofiteror gains charged
on the company at the rate of 0%;".

At the end of Schedule 5 there shall be addedallowing paragraph —

Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201-: exemph for non-
resident’s income

The amendment of Article 118B(1)(ba) by Article 246f the Finance
(2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 281-which has effect for the year of
assessment 2014 and ensuing years, shall not affegct claim for
exemption from income tax that was made by virtuéd o
Article 118B(1)(ba) before the day Article 14 wasethed to come into
force.”.

This Article shall be deemed to have come fotoe on the day this Law
is, in accordance with Standing Orders of the Stafelersey, lodged au
Greffe.

Paragraph (1) shall apply to dividends paidpafter the day this Article
is deemed to have come into force.

Paragraphs (2) and (3) shall have effect ferybar of assessment 2014
and ensuing years.

15 Income arising from possessions out of JerseyAricle 62 and
Schedule 5 amended

(1) After Article 62(1) there shall be inserted th#fowing paragraph —
“(1A) The income in respect of which a person isargeable under
Case V includes the full amount of any income agsfrom a
dividend declared by a company, whether the divdderpaid out
of revenue or capital of the company.”.
(2) In Schedule 5 -
(a) at the beginning of paragraph 13 there shalinberted the sub-
paragraph number “(1)";
(b) after sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph 13 thédrall sadded the
following sub-paragraph —
“(2) Sub-paragraph (1) shall not apply for any yedr assessment
after 2015.”.
States & Page - 25
of Jersey

P.129/2015



Article 16 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2l -

16  Shareholder loans — Article 810 and Schedule ¥reended
(1) Paragraphs (7) to (10) of Article 810 shalldaedeted.
(2) Atthe end of Schedule 5 there shall be addeddllowing paragraph —

“20 Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201-: eleoti in respect of
shareholder loans for year of assessment 2015

The deletion of Article 810(9) and (10) by Artidé(1) of the Finance
(2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 261-which has effect for the year of
assessment 2016 and ensuing years, does not dffectight of a
borrower to make an election, for the year of assest 2015, under
Article 810(9) and (10) as those paragraphs wer@rice prior to their
deletion.”.

(3) This Article shall have effect for the yearasfsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

17 Dividends and distributions — Articles 88 and 13 amended

(1) In Article 88 for paragraphs (5) to (5E) theskall be substituted the
following paragraphs —

“(5) Where a deduction is made from a dividend pard to this
Article —

(@) the person chargeable to tax on the divideadl,sinless the
person is a company to which Article 123C applibs,
entitled to a credit; and

(b) the amount of tax that person is liable to wasespect of the
dividend shall be reduced by the amount of theitred

(5A) Subject to paragraph (5B), the credit shalbban amount equal to
the amount of the deduction.

(5B) If the person chargeable to tax on the divitlésra company to
which Article 123D applies, the credit shall beaof amount equal
to whichever is the lesser of —

(@) 10% of the gross dividend; and
(b)  the amount of the deduction.”.

(2) In Article 133(1), after sub-paragraph (aa)tleé proviso there shall be
inserted the following sub-paragraph —

“(ab) the company or bank shall not be entitledejoayment of any tax
deducted under Article 88(2) or (3) from a dividepaid to the
company or bank;”.

(3) This Article —

(a) shall be deemed to have come into force omdyethis Law is, in
accordance with Standing Orders of the Statesretyelodged au
Greffe; and

((b) shall apply to dividends paid on or after ttate.

Page - 26 S%ateS%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Aetit3

Companies

18 Companies regarded as resident in Jersey — Artece123 amended

(1) In Article 123(1)(a)(i) for the amount “20%"ahe shall be substituted the
amount “10%”.

(2) This Article shall have effect for the yearasfsessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

Pensions

19 Pensions — Article 62, Part 19 and Schedule 1/anded

(1) In Article 62(1) for sub-paragraph (d)(ii) ofa€e lll there shall be
substituted the following clause —

“(iiy any lump sum paid from or under a pensioneue,
annuity contract, retirement trust scheme or simila
arrangement, whether the payment is made on the
death of a pension holder, in commutation of or
otherwise in lieu of a pension, by way of return of
contributions paid by a pension holder, by way of
transfer, or otherwise (other than a payment wisch
taxed under CaseVI, in accordance with
Article 131J(2)(a) or 131L(1));".

(2) In Article 130(2) —

(@) in sub-paragraph (a) the word “and” followiniguse (ii) shall be
deleted and after clause (ii) there shall be adihed following
clause —
| “(iii) the pension holder attaining the age of @d”;

(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for clause (i) there siwl substituted the
following clause —

“(iy a pension holder transfers the whole or pdrhis or
her fund value in an approved Jersey scheme, an in
equivalent scheme (within the meaning of
Article 131CG(7)), to an approved Jersey scheme,
and”.

(3) InArticle 131 —
(@) for paragraph (9) there shall be substitute@ tollowing
paragraph —
“(9) The scheme may provide for the payment, follgghe death of a
member, of either or both of —
| (@) anincome to one or more of the member’'s deguand-

() in the case of a child of the member who is a
dependant by reason of Article 130A(2)(a) but who,
on attaining the age of 23, would not be a dependan

States % Page - 27
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 19 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2l -

by reason of Article 130A(2)(b), until the childahs
the age of 23, or

(i) in the case of any other dependant, for tfe &f the
dependant;

| (b) alump sum to the member’s estate or to anyquet;
(b) after paragraph (15) there shall be inserte@ flollowing
paragraph —

“(15A) The scheme may permit payments other tharetarn of
contributions to be made to the employer —

(@) in exceptional circumstances, such as the windp of the
scheme; and

(b)  with the prior written approval of the Compteol”.

(4) In Article 131B(7) for sub-paragraph (a) thesleall be substituted the
following sub-paragraph —

“(& an annuity to one or more of the individualspendants —

() in the case of a child of the individual who &
dependant by reason of Article 130A(2)(a) but who,
on attaining the age of 23, would not be a dependan
by reason of Article 130A(2)(b), until the childaihs
the age of 23, or

(i) in the case of any other dependant, for tfe &f the
dependant;”.
(5) For Article 131CA(6) there shall be substitutbd following paragraph —

“(6) The scheme may provide for the payment, follaythe death of
the primary beneficiary, of either or both of —

(@) subject to paragraph (6A), a sum by way of #pnu
equivalent to one or more secondary beneficiaries;

(b) a lump sum commuting the whole of the fund gala the
primary beneficiary’s estate or to any person.”.

(6) After Article 131CA(6) there shall be insertide following paragraph —

“(6A) Where a secondary beneficiary is a person vsha dependant of
the primary beneficiary by reason of Article 1306} but who,
on attaining the age of 23, would not be a depeniameason of
Article 130(2)(b), the scheme must provide for fayment of the
sum by way of annuity equivalent to end upon theosdary
beneficiary attaining the age of 23.”.

(7) For Article 131CG(6) there shall be substitutieel following paragraph —

“(6) The scheme manager of an approved Jersey schrerst notify the
Comptroller, in writing, of —

(@) the date of a transfer received in accordandéh w
paragraph (5);

(b) the amount of the transfer;
(c) the name of the scheme from which it was tremstl;
(d) the jurisdiction in which that scheme is egtdidd; and

Page - 28 S%ateS%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- AetR0

| (e) whether benefits have commenced from that seliem
(8) After Article 131J there shall be inserted tbikowing Article —

“131JA Taxation relating to payment from a Jersey acupational pension
scheme to the employer

Where a payment is made from a Jersey occupatamion scheme to
the employer as permitted by Article 131(15A), #mount paid shall be
treated for the purposes of this Law as a recéiffteotrade, profession or
vocation carried on by the employer upon whiches¢ne earlier of —

(a) the payment falling due; and

(b) the last day on which the trade, professionomation is carried on
by the employer.”.
(9) In Article 131L —

(@) in paragraph (1) the words “in commutation oifrolieu of pension
income” shall be deleted,;

(b) in paragraph (4) for the word “commuted” theshall be
substituted the word “paid”.

(10) For Article 131N there shall be substitutegl thllowing Article —

“131IN  Exemption from tax for transfer from approved Jersey scheme
The following transfers shall be exempt from tax —

(a) a transfer, permitted under Article 131CG(2) B), of the whole
or part of a fund value from an approved Jersegrsehto another
approved Jersey scheme or an approved drawdowracgnt

(b) a transfer, permitted under Article 131CG(4),tle whole of a
fund value from an approved Jersey scheme to afvaent
scheme established outside Jersey.”.

(11) After Article 131Q(1)(d) there shall be ingattthe following sub-
paragraph —

“(da) to refuse approval under Article 131(15A);".

(12) This Article shall have effect for the yearasisessment 2016 and ensuing
years.

Collection and administration

20 Disclosure of information — Article 13 amended
(1) Inthe heading to Article 13 the word “statisii’ shall be deleted.
(2) For Article 13(1) there shall be substituted tbllowing paragraphs —
“(1) Notwithstanding anything in this Law, the Cotrgller may, for
any purpose described in paragraph (1A) —
States & Page - 29

of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 21 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2l -

(@) disclose statistical information to the Minister the Chief
Minister; and

(b) disclose any information to an officer in amawistration of
the States for which either the Minister or Chiehldter is
assigned responsibility.

(1A) The purposes are —

(@) the preparation of the general estimate ofréwenue of the
States; and

(b) any other purpose affecting the revenue ofStates.”.

21  Time for delivery of company statement — Articlel7A amended

In Article 17A(2)(b) for the words “6 p.m. on thask Friday in July in the year
in which the notice is served;” there shall be itdted the words “midnight on
31st December in the year in which the notice iigesk”.

22  Revised assessment following apportionment — Actes 24 and 92A
amended

(1) InArticle 24(1) -
(@) the word “or” following sub-paragraph (b) shadl deleted; and
(b) after sub-paragraph (c) there shall be addedmbrd “or” and the
following sub-paragraph —
“(d) that by reason of the apportionment, undes thaw, of an
exemption threshold increase or any allowancegfredr

deduction between a person and one or more others,
amount is recoverable from the person,”.

(2) In Article 92A(8C) the words beginning “and,iifappears” and ending
“recovered from the individual accordingly.” sheé deleted.

23 ITIS rate — Articles 41C, 41D, 41DA and 49B ameled and Schedule 1A
revised

(1) InArticle 41C —

(@) in paragraph (7B) the words “Subject to panplgr®),” shall be
deleted;

(b) paragraph (8) shall be deleted;

(c) in paragraph (9) after the words “The rate’réhshall be inserted
the words “determined by the Comptroller in accoa with
paragraphs (2) to (7B)";

(d) after paragraph (9) there shall be inserted flodlowing
paragraphs —

“(9A) An employee may, at any time, make an electim the
Comptroller to have a rate applied in the employesase that

exceeds the rate determined in accordance withfahegoing
provisions of this Article.

Page - 30 S%ates%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- AatiA

(9B) If the Comptroller agrees the rate propose@nnelection made
under paragraph (9A), the Comptroller shall issuaatice in
writing to the employee of the rate and the dayfsehich the rate
applies.”.

(2) For Article 41D(3) there shall be substitutbd following paragraphs —

“(3) If the Comptroller agrees the adjusted ratesppsed in an election
made under paragraph (2), the Comptroller shalleiss notice in
writing of the rates applicable to the husband aifd and the day
from which the rates apply.

(3A) Article 41C(11) to (13) shall apply to a refdisby the Comptroller,
to issue a notice under paragraph (3) of this krtas they apply to
a refusal to issue a notice under Article 41C(9B).”

(3) For Article 41DA(3) there shall be substituted following paragraphs —

“(3) If the Comptroller agrees the adjusted ratesppsed in an election
made under paragraph (2), the Comptroller shalieiss notice in
writing of the rates applicable to the civil panmand the day from
which the rates apply.

(3A) Article 41C(11) to (13) shall apply to a refisby the Comptroller,
to issue a notice under paragraph (3) of this krtés they apply to
a refusal to issue a notice under Article 41C(9B).”

(4) In Article 49B(4) —
(@) clauses (i) and (j) shall be deleted;
(b) for clause (k) there shall be substituted tiliing clause —

“(k) in paragraph (9) for the words ‘The rate detgred by the
Comptroller in accordance with paragraphs (2)' ¢hehall
be substituted the words ‘The combined effectivée ra
determined by the Comptroller in accordance with
paragraphs (3)’;";
(c) after clause (l) there shall be inserted thiefong clauses —

“(la) in paragraph (9A) for the words ‘a rate’ theshall be
substituted the words ‘a combined effective rate’;

(Ib) in paragraph (9B) for the words ‘the rate’the first
place that they appear there shall be substituted t
words ‘the combined effective rate,’;”.

(5) Schedule 1A is revised to incorporate the amerds and modifications
of the Articles reproduced in it.

PART 2

STAMP DUTIES AND FEES (JERSEY) LAW 1998 AND TAXATI®
(LAND TRANSACTIONS) (JERSEY) LAW 2009 AMENDED

24 Interpretation of Part 2
In this Part —

States % Page - 31
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 25 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2l -

“1998 Law” means the Stamp Duties and Fees (Jetsay)1998;
“2009 Law” means the Taxation (Land Transactiodsygey) Law 2009

25  Schedules to 1998 Law and 2009 Law amended —sed debts and
security interests on residential property

(1) Item 1(a) of the Schedule to the 1998 Law isteel.

(2) Initem 1(aa) of the Schedule to the 1998 Law —

(@) in clause (iv) for the amount “£400,000” thefall be substituted
the amount “£450,0007;

(b) for the second clauses numbered (i) and (igrahshall be
substituted the following clauses —

“(A) where the amount securedlIL Billet Greffier
does not exceed £350,000

(B)  where the amount secureNIL in respect |Billet Greffier”.
exceeds £350,000 but |of the first
does not exceed £450,008350,000 plus

25p for each

£100 or part of
£100 in excess
thereof, subject
to a minimum of
£25

(3) In paragraph 3B of the Schedule to the 2009 aw
(& in sub-paragraph (1)(b), for the amount “£400;0there shall be
substituted the amount “£450,000”;

(b) for clauses (a) and (b) of sub-paragraph (2@rethshall be
substituted the following clauses —

“(a) where the amount secured by the security ageeé does
not exceed £350,000, nil;

(b)  where the amount secured by the security agraeaxceeds
£350,000 but does not exceed £450,000, nil in csgehe
first £350,000 plus 25p for each £100 or part 00E1n
excess thereof, subject to a minimum of £25.”.

(4) Paragraph 5 of the Schedule to the 2009 Laepsaled.

PART 3
CUSTOMS AND EXCISE (JERSEY) LAW 1999 AMENDED

26 Interpretation of Part 3

In this Part, except where the context otherwisguires, a reference to an
Article or Schedule is to the Article or Schedufdlmt number in the Customs
and Excise (Jersey) Law 1999

Page - 32 S%ateS%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Aati7

27  Small independent cider-makers and distillers aépirits — Article 1
amended

In Article 1(1) —

(@) in sub-paragraph (a) of the definition “smaltiépendent cider-maker”
for the amount “20,000 litres” there shall be sitbstd the amount
“500,000 litres™;

(b) for sub-paragraph (a) of the definition “smaibdependent distiller of
spirits” there shall be substituted the followindpgparagraph —

(a) during the period of 5 years ending on the losipre excise
duty is charged on spirits produced by the distilleas not
distilled more than 10,000 litres of alcohol;”.

28  Excise duty (other than vehicle emissions duty) Part 2 of Schedule 1
amended

In Part 2 of Schedule 1 —

(@) for paragraph 1(a) and (b) there shall be #ubet the following sub-
paragraphs —

“(@) on all spirits, produced by a small indeperiddistiller of spirits,
which are imported into or produced or manufacturedersey,
excise duty at the rate of £17.30 per litre of htdpand

(b) on all other spirits imported into or producedmanufactured in
Jersey, excise duty at the rate of £34.57 perditiadcohol.”;

(b) for the table in paragraph 2 there shall bessuted the following table —

“Strength of wines Rate per hectolitre

Wines exceeding 1.2% volume but not
exceeding 5.5% volume £74.70

Wines exceeding 5.5% volume but not
exceeding 15% volume £196.04

Wines exceeding 15% volume but not
exceeding 22% volume £240.23

Rate per litre of alcohol

Wines exceeding 22% volume £34.57",

(c) for paragraph 3(a)(ii) and (iii) there shall babstituted the following
clauses —

“(iiy £30.67 per hectolitre of beer exceeding 2.88tume but not
exceeding 4.9% volume, and

(i) £53.14 per hectolitre of beer exceeding 4.98tume; and”;

(d) for paragraph 3(b)(ii) and (iii) there shall babstituted the following
clauses —

States % Page - 33
of Jersey P.129/2015



Article 29 Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2l -

“(iiy £61.34 per hectolitre of beer exceeding 2.88tume but not
exceeding 4.9% volume, and

(i) £106.26 per hectolitre of beer exceeding 4.¢8ume.”;
(e) for paragraph 4(a)(ii) and (iii) there shall bebstituted the following
clauses —

“(iiy £30.67 per hectolitre of cider exceeding 2.8%lume but
not exceeding 4.9% volume, and

(i) £53.14 per hectolitre of cider exceeding 4.98tume; and”;
(f)  for paragraph 4(b)(ii) and (iii) there shall Isaibstituted the following
clauses —

“(iiy £61.34 per hectolitre of cider exceeding 2.8%lume but
not exceeding 4.9% volume, and

(i) £106.26 per hectolitre of cider exceeding%.9olume.”;

(9) in paragraph 5 for the amount “£32.43" therallsbe substituted the
amount “£34.57";

(h)  for the table in paragraph 6 there shall bessubed the following table —

“Type of tobacco Rate of excise duty
per kilogramme

(@) unprocessed tobacco £280.85

(b) cigars £303.88

(c) cigarettes £379.98

(d)  hand-rolling tobacco £322.98

(e) processed tobacco other than types (b) to (d) 29441";

() for paragraph 7(1)(a) to (d) there shall be stitited the following
clauses —

“(@) on higher octane ultra low sulphur petrol  £287per hectolitre
(b) on all other ultra low sulphur petrol £45 .44t hectolitre
(c) on ultra low sulphur diesel £45.47 per het®li
(d) on all other types of hydrocarbon oil £49.54 pectolitre.”.

29  Vehicle emissions duty — Part 2 of Schedule 1 anded

For paragraph 8 of Part 2 of Schedule 1 there $ladlubstituted the following
paragraph —

“8  Motor vehicles
| (1) Inthis paragraph —

Page - 34 S%ates%
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201-

AetiRO

described in Article 38(3) or (5).

figure established for the motor vehicle shall be —

specified.

‘established C® mass emission figure’ means, in relation to a
vehicle, the grams per kilometre of carbon dioxéueitted by the
vehicle, established in accordance with sub-papdré2) and (3);

‘vehicle emissions duty’ means the excise duty pbeaas

(2) The CQ mass emission figure for a motor vehicle shall be
established when the motor vehicle is first regestan Jersey and
shall be the figure specified in a document produneaccordance
with the requirements for registration that arespribed under
Part 2 of the Motor Vehicle Registration (Jersegy1993.

(3) Where more than one G@ass emission figure is specified in a
document described in sub-paragraph (2), the @@ss emission

(@) the figure specified as the combined figure ibthere is
more than one combined figure, the lowest of them;

(b) where there is no combined figure, the lowegfure

(4) The rate of vehicle emissions duty charged orotor vehicle is —

(@) in the case of a motor vehicle that has arbksted CQ
mass emission figure, the rate specified in col@mof
Table 1 for the motor vehicle’s established C@ass
emission figure, specified in column 1 of Table 1;

(b) in the case of a motor vehicle that does notehan
established C®mass emission figure, the rate specified in
column 2 of Table 2 for the cylinder capacity oé timotor
vehicle’s engine, specified in column 1 of Table 2.

Table 1
Vehicles with established G@ass emission figure
1 2
Established C®mass emission Rate of vehicle emissions duty
figure in grams £
100 or less 0
101-125 50
126-150 150
151-175 250
176-200 400
201-225 750
226-250 1,250
251 or more 1,800

S%ates %
of Jersey P.129/2015

Page - 35



Article 30

Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) L2t -

Table 2
Vehicles without an established €@ass emission figure
1 2
Cylinder capacity of engine in Rate of vehicle emissions duty
cubic centimetres £
1,000 or less 0
1,001-1,400 200
1,401-1,800 350
1,801-2,000 500
2,001-2,500 700
2,501-3,000 1,000
3,001-3,500 1,300
3,501 or more 1,800".

PART 4
CLOSING

30 Citation and commencement
(1) This Law may be cited as the Finance (2016 Btddersey) Law 201-.

(2) Except as provided in Articles 5, 8, 9, 14 afidthis Law shall come into
force on 1st January 2016.

Page - 36 States &
P.129/2015 of Jersey



Draft Finance (2016 Budget) (Jersey) Law 201- Eneso

chapter 24.750
chapter 24.750
P.129/2015

P.129/2015

chapter 24.960
chapter 24.980
chapter 24.660
chapter 25.350

® N o o~ W N B

States %’ Page - 37
of Jersey P.129/2015



