
DRAFT HARBOURS (AMENDMENT No. 31) (JERSEY) REGULATIONS 200-
 
 

_______________
 
 
 

Lodged au Greffe on 10th October 2000
by the Harbours and Airport Committee

 
 

______________________________
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
STATES OF JERSEY

 
STATES GREFFE

 
 

180                                                                                                               2000                                                                                                   P.175
 

Price code: A
Explanatory Note

 
The purpose of these Regulations is to increase the amounts payable in respect of vehicles and goods overstaying on the
harbour.
 
The amount payable is increased from £9.27 to £9.50 per day or part thereof in respect of vehicles other than empty trailers
and from £15.45 to £15.80 per day or part thereof in respect of all other goods for every 10  square metres of quay occupied
by the goods.



Harbours (Administration) (Jersey) Law 1961
____________

 
HARBOURS (AMENDMENT No. 31) (JERSEY) REGULATIONS  2000

____________
 

(Promulgated on the                       day of                                   2000)
____________

 
STATES OF JERSEY

____________
 

The                         day of                         2000
____________

 

                             THE STATES, in pursuance of Article 4 of the Harbours (Administration) (Jersey) Law 1961,[1] as amended,[2]

have made the following Regulations -
 

                             1.         In Regulation 24(2) of the Harbours (Jersey) Regulations  1962,[3] as amended[4] -
 
                             (a)       in sub-paragraph (a) for the amount “£9.27” there shall be substituted the amount “£9.50”; and
 
                             (b)       in sub-paragraph (b) for the amount “£15.45” there shall be substituted the amount “£15.80”.
 

                             2.         The Harbours (Amendment No. 30) (Jersey) Regulations  1999[5] shall be repealed.
 
                             3.         These Regulations may be cited as the Harbours (Amendment No. 31) (Jersey) Regulations 2000 and shall
come into force on the first day of January 2001.

[1]
Recueil des Lois, Volume 1961-1962, page 165.

[2]
Recueil des Lois, Volume 1998, page 424.

[3]
No. 4338.

[4]
Nos. 8479 and 9467.

[5]
No. 9467.


