
STATES OF JERSEY

r
DRAFT FINANCE (JERSEY) LAW 200- (P.209/2004):

AMENDMENT

 

Presented to the States on 14th December 2004
by the Finance and Economics Committee

 

 

 

STATES GREFFE



DRAFT FINANCE (JERSEY) LAW 200- (P.209/2004): AMENDMENT
____________

 
 
PAGE 10, ARTICLE 2 –
 
                     In Article 2, in  the substituted paragraph 5 –
 
                     (a)             in sub-paragraph (a), for the amount “£130.66” substitute the amount “£136.01”;
 
                     (b)             in sub-paragraph (b), for the amount “£141.37” substitute the amount “£147.16”;
 
                     (c)             in sub-paragraph (c), for the amount “£176.80” substitute the amount “£184.04”;
 
                     (d)             in sub-paragraph (d), for the amount “£150.26” substitute the amount “£156.42”;
 
                     (e)             in sub-paragraph (e), for the amount “£136.82” substitute the amount “£142.43”.
 
 
 
FINANCE AND ECONOMICS COMMITTEE


