
STATES OF JERSEY

r
DRAFT BOATS AND SURF-RIDING (CONTROL)

(AMENDMENT No.  27) (JERSEY) REGULATIONS  200-

 

Lodged au Greffe on 29th January 2007
by the Minister for Economic Development

 

 

 

STATES GREFFE





DRAFT BOATS AND SURF-RIDING (CONTROL) (AMENDMENT
No.  27)(JERSEY) REGULATIONS  200-

REPORT

These Regulations are intended as a means of maintaining information for sea rescue purposes, organising
mooring space, checking insurance and promoting safety at sea, depending on the type of craft. The registration
fees have not been increased since 2005.

New Inshore Safety (Jersey) Regulations have been drawn up and are at the consultation stage. It is anticipated
that these will become effective from January 2009 and will replace the Boats and Surf-Riding Regulations.

Financial/manpower implications

It is recommended that the fees should be increased by 8%.

There are no manpower implications. Jersey Harbours however continues to make significant economies in its
workforce. There are no property or ICT implications.



Explanatory Note

These Regulations increase, by 8%, the registration and licence fees payable under the Boats and Surf-Riding
(Control) (Jersey) Regulations 1969. The increase takes effect 7  days after the Regulations are made. The fees
were last increased on 1st January 2004.
 





DRAFT BOATS AND SURF-RIDING (CONTROL) (AMENDMENT
No.  27) (JERSEY) REGULATIONS  200-

Arrangement
Regulation

1                       Fees under the Boats and Surf-Riding (Control (Jersey) Regulations 1969
2                       Revocation
3                       Citation and commencement

 

 





DRAFT BOATS AND SURF-RIDING (CONTROL) (AMENDMENT
No.  27) (JERSEY) REGULATIONS  200-

Made                                                                                                                                     [date to be inserted]

Coming into force                                                                                               [date to be inserted]

THE STATES, in pursuance of Regulation  4 of the Harbours (Administration) (Jersey) Law 1961[1],
have made the following Regulations –

1             Fees under the Boats and Surf-Riding (Control (Jersey) Regulations 1969

(1)       In this Regulation, a reference to a Regulation is to the Regulation of that number in the Boats and

Surf-Riding (Control) (Jersey) Regulations 1969[2].

(2)       In Regulations 2(7), 5(2), 8(2) and 33(1), for the amount “£14.50” there shall be substituted the
amount “£16”.

(3)       In Regulation 13(2)(a), for the amount “£39.06” there shall be substituted the amount “£42”.

(4)       In Regulations 14(2) and 26(2), for the amount “£16.75” there shall be substituted the amount “£18”.

2             Revocation

The Boats and Surf-Riding (Control) (Amendment No.  25) (Jersey) Regulations 2003[3] are revoked.

3             Citation and commencement

These Regulations may be cited as the Boats and Surf-Riding (Control) (Amendment No.  27) (Jersey)
Regulations 200- and shall come into force 7  days after they are made.

 

 
 



[1]                                                                    chapter 19.060
[2]                                                                    chapter 19.060.30
[3]                                                                    R&O.152/2003 (chapter 19.060.30)


