DRAFT COLLECTIVE INVESTMENT FUNDS (AMENDMENT)
(JERSEY) LAW 199

Lodged au Greffe on 19th May 1998
by the Finance and Economics Committee

STATES OF JERSEY

STATES GREFFE

175 1998 P.100

Price code: D



2

Report

The Collective Investment Fund industry is an important part of the
finance sector in Jersey. As at 31st December 1997, £35.9 billion was
held in collective investment funds, for which one or more permits were
held by functionaries of those funds under the Collective Investment

Funds (Jersey) Law 1988 (“the principal Law™).

stment vehicles where, effectively,
t using the expertise of certain
an, investment adviser and

Collective investment funds are inve
investors pool their monies and inves
functionaries such as a fund manager, custodi

SO on.

Since 1988 collective investment funds and their functionaries have had
to comply with the principal Law, which is the earliest regulatory Law
presently  being administered  through the Financial Services
Department. It prohibits a person from being a functionary of a
collective investment fund unless he holds a permit i~.ued under the
Law. It also seeks to regulate such functionaries and the funds for which

they act.

1 Law the regulatory environment in
Jersey and internationally has changed. There is now a greater
expectation from investors (onshore and offshore) to have their risk of
loss from fraud and incompetence reduced. In addition, the international
community today expects a greater degree of co-operation and exchange
of information between regulators in the fight against crime. As a
member of the International Organisation of Securities Commissions
(“10SCO™), Jersey’s framework of regulation must ensufe adequate
investor protection and foster co-operation with other regulatory bodies.
This amendment Law will bring the principal Law into line with similar
regulatory legislation in the Island and ensure that the Collective

Investment Fund industry in Jersey is subject to regulatory control and

supervision in line with internationally recognised standards.

Since the enactment of the principa

ervices Commission (Jersey) Law 1998
d Economics Committee 0 the Jersey
Financial Services Commission all the functions it has under the
principal Law and will alter that Law accordingly. The amendment Law
has therefore been drafted on the basis that the Commission is the
regulatory authority and not the Committee.

Later this year the Financial S
will transfer from the Finance an

The principle proposed changes are -
1.

. . . . . . L
lnf()rmat“)" Wlth legulat()ls 131 ] Othel Jul lSdlCllOllG

A new i i i

[ e Sétl?f: 19C will be inserted. At present, the principal

iy coro ne on whgn and (hg extent to which the Commission
perate with, provide information to, or receive

’ pd oreign regulator i i i
C ar]fy the p()g][-On g g I tor. I hlS new A “(.I(, w l

In i

regﬁzllglcular paragraph (1) of Article 19C will set out as the
f0110wi(r)1ry powers the Commission will be able to‘ use
Commissg' a request by a foreign regulator. For example, the
undertake:onarfou'ld impose a condition on a permit or it c’ould
_ { investigation und i ;
information under Article 8. °r Artiele 19 or obtain

Paragr: ; .
the gO:TE);i(sii)o?fn?mc}l,e I9C will set out the criteria to which
a forcign regu[atUSt I::we regard in deciding whether to assist
assistance would (:)r' or example, whether corresponding
whether it is i ¢ given in the territory concerned and
is in the public interest to give the assistance sought

It shoul i

o :n(lj):r gor:dl tl;z;t the Commission cannot exercise its

Peiating 1o pari cle 'C in order to communicate information

the pacioroma! pants in a collective investment fund without
pant's consent, unless it is information already in the

pu C al I Suc h ¢
bll d()“l nors h t at [lle pCIS()Xl to Whol“ It Iel ites cannot

To enable issi
nab the Commission to disclose informati i
certain circumstances. en

Article ill i i i

o The18r.w11.l insert into .the principal Law Articles 19D to

C'm;mt ¢ de.nClpal Law is silent as to when information can o

o | iv“llscll]?s}(:d l?y the Commission and others These‘ne»\f

: ake it an offence for g |

ees ‘ a person who receiv

Consen?t:)(;nbun}?er the Law to disclose it to others without tlfz
oth the person to whom it relates and the person



4

from whom it was received. The new Articles however will
then go on to set out the circumstances in which this general
duty of confidentiality can be overridden. For example, when
the information is already in the public domain or the
disclosure is for the purpose of criminal, civil or disciplinary
proceedings.

3. To enable an auditor to communicate with the Commission
in good faith, information or an opinion relevant to the
Commission’s function without being in breach of any duty
that he may owe to his client.

Article 18 will insert into the principal Law Article 19K.
Similar provisions exist in other regulatory statutes in Jersey.

4. To enhance the investigatory and information gathering
powers of the Commission.

Articles 8, 15 and 18 would insert new Articles 19A and 19B
and additional provisions into Articles 8 and 19 of the principal
Law. The principal provisions include - (1) Express powers of
entry into premises in certain circumstances by persons
authorised by the Commission; (2) extension of the powers of
investigation and information gathering to former permit
holders or persons who have acted without a permit, Of
otherwise acted unlawfully; (3) making obstruction of an
investigation an offence; and (4) empowering the Court to
order a person convicted of an offence as a result of an
investigation to pay all or some of the CcOStS of the
investigation.

Other amendments include an enabling power for the Committee to
exempt, by Order, schemes oI arrangements which are not to constitute
a collective investment fund for the purposes of the principal Law (see
Article 2(7) of the amending Law); amendments with regard to
applications for permits and the procedure for the granting of permits
(see Article 5, 6 and 7 of the amending Law); wider powers 1O issue
directions to functionaries, directions are at present limited to requiring
a functionary to ceasc jissuing or redeeming units or to wind up a fund
(see Article 10 of the amending Law); a new Article enabling the
Commission 1o prepare Codes of Practice (see Article 11 of the

5

amending Law); an i in crimi
); an increase in criminal penalties (see Article 12 of the

amending Law) and a requi
! equirement for the C issi
of permit holders (see Article 16 inserting Aor?il:lqclsisgl)g 10 keep areister

This draft am
a endment Law has b ,
fund indust i as been subject to consultati i
a iltation
ved. It

llaS d]S() l)eell (:()]lSl(]ele(l a (l a)l)l() e(l )y & I: ancia ;e viCces
v
CO””“ISSIO“ OIgd[llSlllg Comllll[tee



6

Explanatory Note

estment Funds (Jersey) Law

ive Inv
ends (he Colle o he amendments made are

This draft Law am o

1988 (“the principal Law™).

provisions - | )
iati n of permits;

(a) relating to the grant, variation and revocatio p

ay T

l) conle l]lg ‘)l) ers ()‘ e““y [¢) ]Iyl g (6] a
na pCrSOﬂ ca
W n ut an
]“Vest] ation on ‘)eha“ ()f the Jelsey IlIlaIlClal SCIVICCS
COHIHHSSIOH ( [he CO]IHIHSSIOH )7

C Cllilbll[l [he CO”“[USS]()“ 1o issue a COde Of pI aCthG u“deI

the principal Law;

permit holder not to gi\{e .the
thout which the Commission
atter,

(d) making it an offence for a|
Commission information Wity !
might be misled about a material m

s powers in order to

i ommission’ ers 1
(e) for the exercise of the C e O ent

. . ses
assist an authority \yhl.ch.su;')erv(lise
funds in another jurisdiction; an

i ' relating to
f) gulating the disclosure of information
re
( collective investment funds.
endments which

iti s of the am
Article | inserts definitions for the purpose

follow.

es the powers of the Commission

Article 2 clarif Iders under the principal Law.

it to supervise permit ho

amends Article 2 of the'fr:;c,:sequemia] o th
i dment 1 o

The first amen ! ot ¢

funfj,S)'SS (Jersey) Law 1996. The “secogdmmmee”) "

B}mee and Bconomics Committee (“the Co e

ch;mce(;n the recommendation of .the gnective e

i ents which are not 1o constitute €

arrangem

for the purposes of the principal Law.

Article 3

and imposes a duty on

ive i tment
Collective Inves
SRR e Insurance

bles the
prescribe by
schemes and
stment funds

7

Article 4 amends Article 4 of the principal Law (Requirement for
functionary to hold permit) so as to prohibit a limited partnership
established in the Island holding itself out as being a functionary of a
collective investment fund outside the Island unless it has a permit
under the Law. Such activity is already prohibited for companies
incorporated in the Island and for limited liability partnerships
registered in the Island. The penalty for the offence of operating as a
functionary without a permit is increased from a fine and/or up to
2 years’ imprisonment to a fine and/or up to 7years’ imprisonment,
Power is also taken for the Committee to prescribe by Order, on the
recommendation of the Commission, persons or classes of person to
whom the requirement to have a permit for such activity will not apply.

Article 5 amends Article 5 of the principal Law (Application for permit)
so as to -

(a) require the Commission to have regard to the need to
protect the Island’s reputation in financial and
commercial matters when considering an application for a
permit (the Commission is already required to have regard

to the protection of the public and the best economic
interests of the Island); and

(b) require an applicant for a permit to notify the Commission
of any alteration in his application or material change in
the information given by him to the Commission which
occurs after his application is made but before it is
determined by the Commission.

Article 6 amends Article 6 of the principal Law (Grant or refusal of
permit, imposition of conditions and cancellation of permit) so as to -

{a) enable the Commission to attach a condition to a permit to
the effect that all or part of a code of practice issued under
the Article added by Article 11 may not be used in
evidence in proceedings;

(b) enable the Commission to cancel a permit in any case
where the permit holder does not start to operate as a
functionary within a year of the permit being granted and



8

in any case where the permit holder ceases to operate as a

functionary,

(¢) enable the Commission to take into account any failure to
follow a code of practice issued under the Article added
by Article 11 when deciding whether to grant or refuse to
grant, vary or revoke a permit;

(d) require "the Commission to given written notice of a

decision to refuse to grant a permit;

(¢) make a contravention of any condition attached to a
permit an offence liable to a fine and/or up to 5 years’
imprisonment, by virtue of Article 14(3) of the principal
Law as amended by this draft Law, and allow a conviction
for such an offence to be admissible in civil proceedings
as evidence of breach of the condition; and

(fy clarify the Committee’s powers to prescribe by Order, on
the recommendation of the Commission, fees payable by

an existing permit holder.

Article 7 amends Article 7 of the principal Law (Procedure and right of
appeal on refusal or cancellation, etc., of permit) so as to reduce the
minimum period of notice of a decision of the Commission to alter
conditions attached to a permit or revoke a permit from 90 days to
1 month and to enable the Commission, when giving notice to a permit
holder of its decision, to specify a period longer than 1 month at the end
of which the alteration or revocation will take effect. The Commission
is also given a discretion to extend the period specified, upon the
request of the permit holder. The right for a permit holder to request a
written statement of the Commission’s reasons for a decision is
extended to decisions by the Commission to attach a new condition to a
and the time within which the Commission’s statement must be
0 days to 14 days. The period within which an
f the Commission may be made is reduced

permit
given is reduced from 3
appeal against a decision o
from 90 days to 1 month.

Article 8 amends Article 8 of the principal Law (Power to obtain
information and require production of documents) so that -

9

(a) the existin
g power of the Commissi :
hold . - ) mission to require a .
; er to prlov1de information is eXtende(?t permit
ormer permit holders as well: o apply to

(b) the Commissi
sslon may require a i
o / require a permit holder or fo
p t holdfar to furnish it with a report by an Jtant
or person with similar skills;  fecoumtant

(c) a .
infgf;:;ggoﬁuth;nsed by the Commission may ask for
apout any matter he T A
premise he specifies and ent
he prozuf:triotge pfurgosi of obtaining the information 2:
. 0 OOKS Or pa o ;
powers in relation to them: papers or exercising  his

(d) th isti
paf;)eter)s(1§t1nlg power to require production of books and
producelgzrl:;f}s, a power to retain books and papersars]o
. e existing description of
be required to explain them is ex%anded' persons who may

(e) the existi isi i
existing provision limiting the exercise of pow
ers

under the Articl
) € to a case wher i S
hand is removed:; € an investigation is in

(H th i
ex(:e;r)l(()j\évgrfoto re;quxre production of books and papers are
' apply to former permit hold (
ers and
acting unlawfully or who have acted without a ;errgir'sons

(g) obstructin
g a person exercisi
oosn : . ng the power of
" tc:lsjed in gc) is rpade an offence liable to a finoe asg/try
wpto. years imprisonment by virtue of Article 14(3 of
principal Law as amended by this draft Law et

Artic .

anr(tjzclgrgcz[lgeer;ds Article 9 of the principal Law (Misle

and S) SO as to remov :

P e the paragraphs specifyi

concerﬁégni]it;c?ge of lt(he offences contained %n Flz\rticlgepgaiﬁ:’lgh e
: e making of misleadi 'misleading

onee ing statem i i

p ces. The penalty for an offence under Article ;?;Si:cnrdeal;:;l?admg

rom a

fine and/

or up to 7 }’Cars’ i .
. mpris -
imprisonment. prisonment to a fine and/or u

ading statements

p to 10 years’



10

Article 10 substitutes Article 12 of the principa'l Law (DlreCtl'OH.S). The
substituted Article specifies the grounds on which the Commlssmln ma)li
give directions in respect of a collectivc.: investment fund orac asst())
fund and expands upon the kinds of requirement that may 'bellmptoseva y
way of a direction. Power is introduced for the Co'mm}ssm‘n 0 y hrg';
withdraw or issue further directions and to make public dlrectlgns. i s
given. A right is introduced for a person to apply to the Comr]:nsil(;n or
the withdrawal or variation of a direction Z{nd to appeal to the ’rilgr
Number of the Royal Court against a direct!on or a reﬁfsal to thd rz;\:l/
or vary a direction. Failure to comply V\{th a.dlrectlon i)s m.a'gn "
offence liable to a fine and/or up to 2 years’ imprisonment. Provisior ’
included for a conviction under this Ar[.lcle. to be a§lm1551ble in civi
proceedings as evidence of the facts constituting the offence.

Article 11 inserts a new Article in the principal Law enabling the
Commission, after consultation with .interested persons, to pgei).ar:tg
code of practice in respect of any functlop _of a functionary in rg a(‘j(')nate
a collective investment fund, or any provision of the Law or su'(;)r i t©
legislation made under it. The code will be admissible in E;)Vl erllceant
civil and criminal proceedings if it appears to the court to be relev
and, if relevant, shall be taken into account.

Article [2 amends Article 14 of the principal Law (Offences and
penalties) so as to -

(a) extend the offence of removing, destr(_)ying, cox}ceallr;g 0;
altering papers with intent to avoid detectlon. o ah
offence to apply to a person who causes or permits suc
removal, destruction, concealment or alteration;

(b) make it an offence for a ‘permil hglder, or a.dperstﬁg
required to hold a permit, to fail to provide "
Commission  with  information releyant to the
Commission’s functions in relation to him and without
which the Commission may be misled about a matter
material to the exercise of its functions;

(c) make it an offence for any person to contravene any
provision of an Order made under the Law;

1

(d) have the effect that where a person commits the offence
of obstructing an authorised person exercising powers of
entry under Article 8 of the principal Law or an inspector
exercising powers of entry under Article 19 of the
principal Law, continued obstruction will constitute a
further offence subject to a daily penalty; and

(e) increase the penalty for any offence under the Law for
which no special penalty is provided and for 3 continuing
failure to provide information etc. from an unlimited fine
and/or up to 2 years’ imprisonment to an unlimited fine
and/or up to 5 years’ imprisonment.

Article 13 inserts a new Article in the principal Law enabling the
Commission to issue a public statement about a person who appears to
have contravened certain requirements of the Law or who has failed to
comply with a code of practice issued under the Law or where it appears
that it would be in the interests of participants or potential participants
in a collective investment fund to do so. If the Statement relates to a
permit holder or former permit holder, that person must be given 7 days’
notice of the statement before it is published.

Article 14 amends Article 15 of the principal Law (Legal proceedings)
with the effect that a principal person (for whom a definition is added
by Article 1) who consents to or connives in the commission of an
offence by a permit holder or former permit holder or by a person
acting without a permit is guilty of that offence and liable accordingly.
Similarly, provision is added whereby a partner or officer of a
partnership or manager or other officer of an association who consents
to or connives in the commission of an offence by the partnership or
association is also guilty of that offence and liable accordingly. A

director or other officer of a company may already be found so guilty
and liable.

Article 15 makes an amendment to Article 16 of the principal Law
(Accessories and abettors) which is consequential upon the amendment
made by Article 14,

Article 16 amends Article 18 of the principal Law (Service of notices)

SO as to enable service by telex, facsimile or other electronic
transmission.



12

. oo b
Article 17 amends Article 19 of the principal Law (Investigation by

Commission) so as to -

ion’ i igation to
(a) extend the Commission’s pPOWEIS of.tmgfsstlriitsonable
i d to persons 1 :
former permit holders and t :
cause topbelieve have committed an offence of making

misleading statement or concealing facts;

(b) provide that a person need not dis.close any information
protected by legal professional privilege;

i issi oca
(c) give an inspector appointed by the tCorrl;rrzlélsilsc:; tfor thrr)e'
i igati wer to enter
out an investigation po ‘ s |
purpose of carrying out his duties under the Article;

n inspector exercising pO\g/ers of
i i d/or up to 5 years

offence liable to a fine an e
?1r:3is?)?\ment by virtue of Article 14(3) of the principal

Law as amended by this draft Law;

(d) make obstruction of a

r a person convicted of an offence

(e) enable the court to orde all or some of the

as a result of an investigation to pay
costs of the investigation.

. o the
[ isions to the principal Law concerning t
Moo mf aiiir?ftﬁ\gprz?r:/ 1invc:stigation, the issue of warrz'ims tt))y ;Ez
Off?{\cfi 3 Ohe entry and search of premises, co-opgratlgn )timem
Bﬂ‘hﬁ. fQT t ith an authority which supervises collective myeE y
?Olg;misnsuz)l?w\;vtier ‘jurisdiction (“relevant supervisory authority”) an
un

disclosure of information.

igati i fence for a
Article 19A (Obstruction of investigations) makes it an of

. . . or
to falsify, conceal, destroy or dlsppse of bmfoeremdzg(;gr o

Szrcsi?]cms if he knows that they are needed ortl(;kglr)(l) \t/c; t(; :[ e o

i rson

%“VCS[}gmion: N ;zslli?lgdg:?scszé)lrosaedpﬁy the information or doufxmeg:z

Inienion o ereon carrying out the investigation. The penalty. or ot

ofter lhc’ pers?irr]xe a;rc)i//or up to 5 years’ imprisopment by virtue

(/)\frfﬁzlbf 1145(32; of the principal Law as amended by this draft Law.

13

Article 19B (Entry and search of premises) is added to the principal
Law to allow an application to be made to the Bailiff for a warrant to
enter and search premises where it is likely that, if prior notice of entry
were given, papers etc. would be removed or destroyed or the entry
obstructed, or where a previous entry on premises made after giving
notice has met with obstruction or non-co-operation. The warrant will
authorise a police officer, and any other person named in the warrant, to
enter the premises. If necessary, the entry may be forced. Books and
papers may be retained and copied and persons questioned. The warrant
expires | month after it is issued. Books or papers retained can be kept
for up to a year, or until any relevant proceedings have ended. If books
or papers are kept, a person needing to use them for business purposes
can ask for copies. Obstruction of a person exercising powers under a
warrant is an offence liable to a fine and/or up to 5 years’ imprisonment

by virtue of Article 14(3) of the principal Law as amended by this draft
Law.

Article 19C (Co-operation with relevant supervisory authority) is added
to the principal Law to enable the Commission to exercise the powers
specified in paragraph (1) at the request of or for the purpose of
assisting a relevant supervisory authority in the exercise of its
supervisory functions. The Commission can disclose information to a
relevant supervisory authority but, if it relates to a participant in a
collective investment fund, the information must already be in the
public domain or such that the person it relates to cannot be identified
from it, or the Commission must have the participant’s consent to the
disclosure. Paragraph (4) specifies the matters which the Commission
must take into account in deciding whether or not to give such
assistance. The Commission can refuse to assist if the relevant

supervisory authority does not undertake to contribute towards the costs
of such assistance.

Articles 19D to 19J are added to the principal Law to deal with
disclosure.

Article 19D (Restriction on disclosure of information) makes it an
offence for a person who receives information for the purposes of the
Law to disclose it without the consent of the person it relates to and the
person from whom it is received. By virtue of Article 14(3) of the
principal Law as amended by this draft Law, the penalty for the offence
is a fine and/or up to 5 years’ imprisonment.



14

Article 19D does not apply to -

(a) information

(Article 19D(2)(a));

(b) information from which

()

(d)

(e)

()

(2)

e of the
disclosure for the purpose O
W suspected offence or of criminal,

(i)

V)

person to whom it relates (Article 1

ission to
disclosure by the Commlssx .
authority under Article 19C (Articl

disclosure to assist the.
functions under the prl
which it has a supervisory

disclosure by the Commission to
holder, former permit holder or

have acted without a permit L0 assiS

the discharge of its furllctionsiE
interests of investors (Article 19

i ission to a professi !
disc o Cor:l:; his advice (Article 19E(3));

the purpose of obtai

disclosure by
connection wit

proceedings (Article 19G(1));

ission
disclosure by the Commis
behalf to the Attorney Genera
information obtainfed lutn
i e
rincipal Law or of rela
gf a prosecution (Artticle 19G(2)

disclosure by the Commissxpn
behalf to an inspector appointe

already in  the public ~ domain

it is not possible to identify the

9D(2)(b));

a relevant supervisory
¢ 19D(3));

ission i ischarge of its
Commission in the disc
ncipal Law and other Laws under
function (Article 19E(D);

the auditor of a permit
person who appears Fo
t the Commission 10
or where it is in the

),

onal person for

the Commission to the .Viscoulx::lt. in
h bankruptcy proceedings (Article 19F);

investigation pf a
civil or disciplinary

or a person acting on 1ts

1 or a police officer of

der Article 8 or 19 of the
d information, for the purposes

);

i its
or a person acting on 1
d under Article 19 of the

15

principal Law or appointed to investigate insider dealing
or companies (Article 19G(3));

(k) disclosure by the Commission to any person or body
responsible for a scheme for compensating investors
provided that, if the information relates to a participant in

a collective investment fund, that person consents to the
disclosure (Article 19G(4)).

Atticle 19H (Attachment of conditions to disclosure) prohibits the
disclosure of information in the circumstances described in
paragraph (k) above or in the exercise of the Commission’s power under
Article 19C to pass on information to relevant supervisory authorities
unless the Commission is satisfied that the recipient of the information

will comply with such conditions as the Commission attaches to its
disclosure.

Article  19J (Information supplied to Commission by relevant
supervisory authority) extends the prohibition on disclosure of
information in Article 19D to information supplied by a relevant
supervisory authority to the Commission.

Article 19K (Communication by auditor and other persons with
Commission) has the effect that an auditor or an accountant or other
professional person appointed to prepare a report required by the
Commission who communicates to the Commission information or an
opinion relevant to the Commission’s functions shall not be in breach of
any duty that he owes. The Committee is empowered to make an Order,
on the recommendation of the Commission, specifying circumstances in
which such persons will be required to communicate information or any
opinion to the Commission. Failure to comply with such an Order will
be an offence subject to a fine and/or up to 6 months’ imprisonment.

Article 19L (Register of holders of permits) requires the Commission to

keep a register of permit holders and for the register to be available for
inspection by members of the public.

Article ]9 amends Article 20 of the principal Law (Applications to
court) to enable a person to apply to court for the setting aside or
variation of an order of the court waiving the requirement that
I month’s notice is given of variation or revocation of a permit,



16

17

i inci hich
Article 20 inserts a new Article 22A (Fees) in the principal ;z(ijw t\g' o
makes it clear that fees payable gnde(ri 1tlt;e flzﬁ\:p?;inga] e
ission. By virtue of Articles 13 an 0 . by
gg?}ig:;ﬁn (Jc}alrsey) Law 1998 they are accordingly funds
resources of the Commission.

COLLECTIVE INVESTMENT FUNDS (AMENDMENT)
(JERSEY) LAW 199

A LAW to amend the Collective Investment Funds (Jersey) Law

1988, sanctioned by Order of Her Majesty in Council of

i 101,

{Registered on the day of 199 )

STATES OF JERSEY

The day of 199

THE STATES, subject to the sanction of Her Most Excellent
Majesty in Council, have adopted the following Law -

ARTICLE 1

In the Collective Investment Funds (Jersey) Law 1988,' as

amended (referred to in this Law as the “principal Law”), in Article 1,
in paragraph (1) -

(a) before the definition of “books and papers” there shall be
inserted the following definition -

“ ‘associate’, in relation to a person, means -

(a) the person’s husband, wife, child or stepchild,

(b) his partner;

(c) any company of which he is a director;

! Volume 1988-1989, page 135.



18

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

any director or

(d) where the person is a company,
in the

employee of the company, any company
same group as the company, and any director or

employee of such a company; and

erson with whom the first mentioned

(e) any p
t or other

person has an agreement, arrangemen

obligation -

(i) to act together in exercising voting power,

(i) with respect to the acquisition, holding or
disposal of shares or other interests in a
body corporate, partnership or other
association;”;

(b) after the definition of “books and papers” there shall be

inserted the following definition -

« ‘code of practice’ means a code prepared and from

time to time revised pursuant (o paragraph (1) of
Article 13A (Codes of practice);”;
(¢) after the definition of “functionary” there shall be inserted
the following definitions -

“ ‘holding company’ has the meaning given in
Article 2 of the Companies (Jersey) Law 1991,

includes a partnership constituted

‘partnership’
ry outside the

under the law of a country or territo
Bailiwick;”;

(d) after the definition of “prescribed” there shall be inserted

the following definition -

« ‘principal person’ means -

19

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersev) Law 199

in relation to a person -
(a) being a sole trader, the proprietor;
(b) being a company -

; .
(i) a per§on who, either alone or with any
associate or associates -

(A) directly or indirectly holds ten per
f:ent or more of the share capital
issued by the company; or

(B) is ent_itled to exercise or control the
exercise of not less than ten per cent
of the voting power in general
meeting of the company or of any
other company of which it is a
subsidiary; or

(@) hgs a holding in the compan
dlrec'tly or indirectly which makes 1};
posmble to exercise significant
influence over the management of
the company;

(ii) a director or equi
equivalent b
called; y whatever name

(iii) a' pe.rson in accordance with whos
filrgcuons, whether given directl oe
1Qd1rect]y, any director of the compag o:
girector of any other company of w{l,ich
aciustg(r)nrr;gany is a subsidiary, is
adVicegivenito act (l?ut disregarding

n a professional capacity);

(c) beinga partnership -



20
Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199
(i) a partner;

(ii) where a partner is a company, any person
who, in relation to that company, falls
within sub-paragraphs (i), (ii) or (iii) of
paragraph (b); and

in relation to a person whose registered office and
principal place of business is outside the Bailiwick,
includes a person who, either alone or jointly with
one or more other persons, is responsible for the
conduct of the person’s business in the Bailiwick;
and

in relation to a person who has become bankrupt,
includes a person who has been appointed as
liquidator or administrator of the person’s affairs;”;

(e) after the definition of “register” there shall be inserted the
following definition -

“ ‘relevant supervisory authority’ means an authority
discharging in a country or territory outside the
Bailiwick supervisory functions corresponding to
those of the Commission in the Bailiwick in respect
of banking, insurance, investment business or other
financial services, including collective investment
funds;”;

(f) after the definition of “Schedule” there shall be inserted
the following definition -

“ *subsidiary’ has the meaning given in Article 2 of
the Companies (Jersey) Law 1991;".

ARTICLE 2

After Article 1 of the principal Law there shall be inserted the

following Article -

21

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

“ARTICLE 1A
Functions of the Commission

The Commission shall have the powers conferred on it by
this Law and the duty generally to supervise the persons
granted permits by it in the exercise of those powers.”.

ARTICLE 3
In Article 2 of the principal Law -
(a) in paragraph (4) -

(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for the words “the First
Schedule to the Insurance Business (Jersey) Law
1983 there shall be substituted the words “Part I of
the First Schedule to the Insurance Business (Jersey)
Law 1996”,

(ii) in sub-paragraph (b), for the words “that Schedule”
there shall be substituted the words “that Part”;

(b) after paragraph (6) there shall be added the following
paragraph -

“(7) Schemes and arrangements may be prescribed,
either by name or description, which are not to constitute
collective investment funds for the purposes of this
Law.”.

ARTICLE 4
In Article 4 of the principal Law -

(a) in paragraph (2), after the words “Limited Liability
Partnerships (Jersey) Law 1997 there shall be inserted

the words “or limited partnership established in



22

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(b)

(c)

accordance with the Limited Partnerships (Jersey) Law
1994,

in paragraph (3), after the words “guilty of an foence”
there shall be inserted the words “and liable to a fine or to
imprisonment for a term not exceeding seven years or to
both such fine and such imprisonment”;

in paragraph (4), for the words “Paragraph (1)” there shall
be substituted the words “Paragraphs (1) and (2)”.

ARTICLE 5

In Article 5 of the principal Law -

(a)

(b)

in paragraph (3), after the words “the public” there shall
be inserted the words “ to the need to protect the
reputation of the Bailiwick in financial and commercial

matters”™; and

after paragraph (3) there shall be added the following
paragraph -

“(4) An applicant who, while his application is
awaiting consideration by the Commission -

(a) determines to bring about any alteration in it;
or

(b) becomes aware of any event which may affect
in any material respect any information
furnished by him to the Commission in
connection with his application,

shall forthwith give written notice of that matter to the
Commission.”.

23

Collective Investment Funds {Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

ARTICLE 6

In Article 6 of the principal Law -

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

after paragraph (4) there shall be inserted the following
paragraph -

“(4A) Conditions attached, varied or prescribed
under paragraph (1), (3) or (4) may indicate that a code of
practice is to be wholly or partly disregarded for the
purposes of paragraph (4) of Article [3A (Codes of
practice);

in paragraph (5), after the word “paragraphs” there shall
be inserted the word “(1),”;

in paragraph (6) -

(i) in sub-paragraph (a), for the words beginning “in or
from within” to the end of the sub-paragraph there
shall be substituted the words “for which the permit
is granted within one year of the date of the grant”,
and

(i) in sub-paragraph (b), for the words “in or from
within the Bailiwick” there shall be substituted the
words “for which the permit is granted”:

after paragraph (6) there shall be inserted the following
paragraph -

“(6A) In exercising its powers under this Article the
Commission may have regard to any failure on the part of
the applicant for a permit or the holder of a permit, as the
case may be, to follow any principles or guidance
contained in a code of practice.”:

in paragraph (7) -



24

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

()

(g)

(i) after the words “If the Commission” there shall be
inserted the words *“acting under paragraph (1)
refuses to grant a permit or”, and

(ii) for the words “the holder of the permit” there shall
be substituted the words “the applicant or the holder
of the permit, as the case may be”;

after paragraph (7) there shall be inserted the following
paragraphs -

“(7A) Any person who contravenes or fails to
comply with any condition attached to a permit under
paragraph (1) or (3) or any condition applicable to a
permit under paragraph (4) shall be guilty of an offence in
respect of each such contravention.

(7B) The record of the conviction of any person for
an offence under paragraph (7A) shall be admissible in
civil proceedings as evidence of the fact of the breach of a
condition attached or applicable under this Article.”;

for paragraph (8) there shall be substituted the following
paragraph -

“(8) Fees may be prescribed which shall be payable
by the holder of a permit -

(a) atsuch intervals as may be prescribed; and

(b) upon the occurrence of such events as may be
prescribed.”.

ARTICLE7

In Article 7 of the principal Law -

(a)

in paragraph (1) -

25

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(b)

()

(i) for sub-paragraph (a) there shall be substituted the
following sub-paragraph -

“(a) such period as is specified in the notice in
writing of the variation, new condition or
revocation, being a period of not less than
one month beginning on the day the
notice is given to the holder of the permit;

[T}

or,

(i) in sub-paragraph (b), for the word “abandoned”
there shall be substituted the word “withdrawn™,

(iii) for the words “(but if may take effect earlier at the
request of the holder of the permit)” there shall be
substituted the words “(but may, at the request of the
holder of the permit, take effect earlier or, if the
Commission so agrees, later).”;

in paragraph (2) -

(i) after the words “or varies any such condition,” there
shall be inserted the words “or attaches a new
condition to a permit”,

(if) for the word “thirty” there shall be substituted the
word “fourteen’;

in paragraph (4), for the words “ninety days” there shall
be substituted the words “one month”.

ARTICLE 8

In Article 8 of the principal Law -

(a)

in paragraph (1), after the words “a holder of a permit”
‘there shall be inserted the words “or a former holder of a
permit”;



26

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(b) after paragraph (1) there shall be inserted the following

paragraph -

“(1A) The Commission may require a holder of a
permit or a former holder of a permit to furnish the
Commission at specified times or intervals with a report
by an accountant or other person with relevant
professional skills nominated or approved by the
Commission on specified matters, in such form as may be

27

Collective Investment Funds (Amendhent) (Jersey) Law 199

(e) in paragraph (4), in sub-paragraph (a) -

(i) in clause (i), after the word “to” there shall be

inserted the words “retain or”, and

(ii) for clause (ii) there shall be substituted the following

clause -

specified.”;

(c) in paragraph (2) for sub-paragraph (b) there shall be

substituted the following sub-paragraph -

“(b) authorise any person on producing (if required
to do so) evidence of his authority to require a

holder of a permit to -

(i) furnish him, at such time as he may

specify, with information about

matter which he may specify being, if he
so requires, information verified in a

specified manner, and

(i) produce to him forthwith any books or

papers which he may specify.”;

(d) in paragraph (3) -

(i) after the words “books or papers from™ in the first
place where they appear, there shall be inserted the

words “or the furnishing of information by”,

®

(g)

“(ii) to require the person producing them, any
person who appears to be in possession of
relevant information or any person who is
or has been a director, controller, auditor
or employee of the holder of the permit,
to provide an explanation of any of
them;”;

for paragraph (5) there shall be substituted the following
paragraph -

“(5) A person authorised by the Commission
pursuant to sub-paragraph (b) of paragraph (2) may,
having given prior written notice of his intention to do so
and on producing, if required, evidence of his authority,
enter, at a reasonable time, any premises occupied by a
person required by him to produce specified books or
papers or furnish specified information, or any other
premises where the books or papers are kept by that other
person, for the purpose of obtaining the books or papers
or information or of exercising the powers conferred by
paragraph (4), as the case may be.”;

in paragraph (6), after the words “this Article” there shall

(ii) after the words “books or papers from” in the second
place where they appear there shall be inserted the
words “or the furnishing of that information by”,

(iii) after the words “such books or papers” there shall be
inserted the words “or information”;

be inserted the words ‘“or obstructs a person exercising

powers under paragraph 57

(h) after paragraph (7) there shall be inserted the following

paragraph -



28

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

“(TA) A statement made by a person in
compliance with a requirement imposed by virtue of this
Article may not be used by the prosecution in evidence
against him in any criminal proceedings except
proceedings under paragraph (6) of this Article or
paragraph (1), (2A) or (4) of Article 14 (Offences and
penalties).”;

(j) in paragraph (8), for the words “any person who appears
to the Commission to be acting” there shall be substituted
the words “a former holder of a permit, to any person who
the Commission has reasonable cause to believe has
committed an offence under the provisions of Article 9
(Misleading statements and practices) and to any person
who appears to the Commission to be acting or to have
acted”.

ARTICLE 9
In Article 9 of the principal Law -
(a) paragraphs (4) and (5) shall be deleted;
(b) in paragraph (6), in sub-paragraphs (a) and (b), after the
words “any agreement” there shall be inserted the words

“or arrangement”; and

(¢) in paragraph (7), for the words “seven years” there shall
be substituted the words “ten years”.

ARTICLE 10

For Article 12 of the principal Law there shall be substituted
the following Article -

29

Collective Investment Funds (Amen!iment) (Jersey) Law 199

“ARTICLE 12
Directions

(1) If it appears to the Commission, in relation to a
collective investment fund, or any class of such fund, that -

(a) any requirements in relation to the collective
investment fund or the class thereof are no longer
satisfied;

(b) it is in the best interests of potential participants in
the collective investment fund or of creditors of the
collective investment fund;

(c) it is desirable in order to protect the reputation and
integrity of the Bailiwick in financial and
commercial matters;

(d) it is in the best economic interests of the Bailiwick;
or

(e) any prospectus or other form of promotion of a
collective investment fund published or made
available, or proposed to be published or made
available by or on behalf of any functionary of a
collective investment fund or any class thereof is
misleading or undesirable,

the Commission may, whenever it deems it necessary, give, by
notice in writing, such directions as it may deem appropriate in
the circumstances; and any person to whom the notice is given
shall obey, comply with and otherwise give effect to any such
direction within the time and in the manner stated in the
direction.

(2) Without prejudice to the generality of paragraph (1),
a direction under this Article may -



30 31

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199 Collective Investment Funds (Amena‘nent) (Jersey) Law 199

(a) require anything to be done or be omitted to be done,
or impose any prohibition, restriction or limitation,
or any other requirement, and confer powers, with
respect to any transaction or other act, or to any
assets, or to any other thing whatsoever;

(b) require that any principal person in relation to any
functionary of a collective investment fund or any
class thereof be removed or removed and replaced
by another person acceptable to the Commission;

(c) require a functionary of a collective investment fund
or any class thereof to cease the issue or redemption,
or both the issue and redemption of units on a date
specified in the direction, either until such further
date as is specified in that or another direction or
indefinitely;

(d) require a functionary of a collective investment fund
or any class thereof to wind up the affairs of the
collective investment fund, in accordance with such
procedures and directions as may be specified in the
direction, which may provide for the appointment of
a person to take possession and control of
documents, records, assets and property belonging to
or in the possession or control of the functionary;

(e) prohibit the publication or making available of a
particular prospectus or any other form of promotion
of a collective investment fund or any class thereof;
or

(f) require that any particular prospectus or other form
of promotion of a collective investment fund or any
class thereof be modified in a specified manner.

(3) The power to give directions under this Article shall
include the power to vary or withdraw any direction, as well as
the power to issue furtrer directions.

(4) Where the Commission is satisfied that the
circumstances so warrant, it may at any time make public any
directions it has given under any of the provisions of this
Article.

(5) Any person to whom a direction is given under
paragraph (1) may apply to the Commission to have it
withdrawn or varied and the Commission shall withdraw or
vary the direction in whole or in part if it considers that there
are no longer any grounds under any of sub-paragraphs (a) to
(e) of paragraph (1) which justify the direction or part of the
direction concerned.

(6) Any person aggrieved by a direction given to him
under paragraph (1), or a refusal to withdraw or vary a
direction pursuant to paragraph (5), may appeal to the court,
either in term or in vacation, within one month from the date on
which the direction was given or refusal was made on the
ground that the decision of the Commission was unreasonable
having regard to all the circumstances of the case.

(7) Other than with respect to a direction to wind up the
affairs of a collective investment fund, an appeal made under
paragraph (6) shall not suspend the operation of any direction
in connection with which the appeal is made.

(8) On an appeal under paragraph (6), the court may
make such order as it thinks fit with respect to the whole or any
part of the direction concerned.

(9) Any person who contravenes or fails to comply with
any of the provisions of a direction given under this Article
shall be guilty of an offence and liable to a fine or to
imprisonment for a term not exceeding two years or to both
such fine and such imprisonment.



32

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(10) The record of the conviction of any person for an
offence.under paragraph (9) shall be admissible in any civil
proceedings as evidence of the facts constituting the offence.”.

ARTICLE 11

After Article 13 of the principal L i
the following Aieres p pal Law, there shall be inserted

“ARTICLE 13A
Codes of practice

(I) The Commission may, after consultation with such

persons as appear to be representative of the interests
concerned -

(a) prepare a code for the purpose of establishing sound
principles and providing practical guidance in
respect of any function of a functionary in relation to
a collective investment fund and any provision of

thi; Law or any Regulations or Order made under it;
an

)} revise. any such code by revoking, varying,
amending or adding to the provisions of the code,

' '(2) The Commission shall ensure that a code of practice
1s printed and available to the public in the Bailiwick and such
a .code may be made available by being put on sa]’e at such
price as the Commission considers reasonable.,

(3) Subject to paragraphs (4) and (5), a failure on the
part .Of any person to follow any principles or guidance
contained in a code of practice shall not itself render that

person liable to proceedings of any ki i i
| nd or in
transaction. g velidate any

33

Collective Investment Funds (Amem)ment) (Jersey) Law 199

(4) Subject to paragraph (4A) of Article 6 (Grant or
refusal of permit, imposition of conditions and cancellation of
permit), in any proceedings under this Law or otherwise, a code
of practice shall be admissible in evidence if it appears to the
court conducting the proceedings to be relevant to any question
arising in the proceedings, and shall be taken into account in
determining any such question.

(5) A copy certified in writing on behalf of the
Commission to be an accurate copy of a code of practice or any
part of such a code shall be admissible in all legal proceedings
as of equal validity with the original and as evidence of any
fact stated in it of which direct oral evidence would be
admissible.

(6) Where a document purports on its face to be a copy
of a code of practice or part of such a code, certified in
accordance with paragraph (5), it shall be unnecessary for the
purposes of paragraph (5) to prove the official position or
handwriting of the person signing on behalf of the
Commission.

(7) In paragraph (1), references to the Commission
preparing a code include references to the Commission
adopting, with or without modifications, a code prepared by
any other person, whether within or outside the Bailiwick.”.

ARTICLE 12
In Article 14 of the principal Law -

(a) for paragraph (2) there shall be substituted the following
paragraphs -

“(2) Any person who, with intent to avoid detection
of the commission of an offence under this Law, removes
out of the jurisdiction, destroys, conceals or fraudulently
alters any books or papers, or causes or permits the



34

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(b)

(c)

removal, destruction, concealment or fraudulent alteration
of any books or papers, shall be guilty of an offence.

(2A) A holder of a permit shall be guilty of an
offence if he fails to provide the Commission with any
information in his possession knowing or having
reasonable cause to believe that -

(a) the information is relevant to the exercise by
the Commission of its functions under this Law
in relation to him; and

(b) the withholding of the information is likely to
result in the Commission being misled as to
any matter which is relevant to and of material
significance for the exercise of those functions
in refation to him.

(2B) The reference in paragraph (2A) to a holder of
a permit includes a reference to any person who appears
to the Commission to be acting or to have acted in
contravention of the provisions of paragraph (1) or (2) of
Article 4 (Requirement for functionary to hold permit).

(2C) Any person who contravenes any provision of
an Order made under this Law, other than an Order made
under paragraph (4) of Article 19K (Communication by
auditor and other persons with Commission) shall be
guilty of an offence.”;

in paragraph (3), for the words “two years” there shall be
substituted the words “five years”;

in paragraph (4) -

(i) after the words “Article 8 (Power to obtain
information etc.)” there shall be inserted the words
“or continues to obstruct a person exercising powers

35

Collective Investment Funds (Amendm‘ent) (Jersey) Law 199

under paragraph (5) of that Article or paragraph (4B)

of Article 197,

(ii) after the words “that failure” there shall be inserted

M 9
the words *“or obstruction™,

(iii) after the words “the failure” there shall be inserted

. "
the words “or obstruction,

(iv) for the words “two years” there shall be substituted

the words “five years”.

ARTICLE 13

After Article 14 of the principal Law there shall be inserted the

following Article -

“ARTICLE 14A
Public statements

(1) The Commission may issue a public statement
concerning a person if that person -

. .
(a) appears to the Commission to have contravened 0

failed to comply with -

(i) paragraph (1) or (2) of Article 4 (Requirement
for functionary to hold permit),

i it

(ii) any condition attached or applicable tofa pennit
under Article 6 (Grant or refusal o perm f
jmposition of conditions and cancellation ©

permit),

9 (Misleading

(iii) any provision of Article e

statements and practices) Of Article
(Offences and penalues),



36

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(iv) any direction given under Article 12
(Directions), or

(v) any Regulations or Order made under this Law;

or

(b) has failed to comply with a code of practice.

(2) The Commission may issue a public statement
concerning a person who is or the Commission believes to be
holding himself out as a functionary of a collective investment
fund, whether in the Bailiwick or elsewhere, if it appears to the
Commission to be desirable to do so in the interests of

participants or potential participants in the collective
investment fund.

(3) Where a public statement issued under this Article
concerns a holder of a permit or a former holder of a permit,
the Commission shall, at least seven days prior to the
publication of the statement, give written notice to the person

concerned of the proposed statement and of the reasons for
which it intends to act.”,

ARTICLE 14

In Article 15 of the principal Law, for paragraph (1) there shall
be substituted the following paragraphs -

“(1) Where an offence under this Law committed by a
holder of a permit or former holder of a permit or by a person
acting in contravention of the provisions of paragraph (1) or (2)
of Article 4 (Requirement for functionary to hold permit) is
proved to have been committed with the consent or connivance
of, or to be attributable to any neglect on the part of a person
who is or was a principal person in relation to that offender,
that principal person shall be guilty of the offence and liable in
the same manner as the offender to the penalty provided for
that offence. '

37

Jersey) Law 199
Collective Investment Funds (Amendme{lt) (

his Law committed by 2

t X
(1A) Where an offence under d association 1s proved

i rate
partnership, compet (er uﬁ?ig? SOnsent or connivance of, or
mmitted wi
to have been €O

the part of a person who is a
o attributable tt(T)laarrllzggf,g lzztr:t[;ry of other similar ofﬁc:rrssrf‘
Mt s dlreCt}?Y, company of association or any t?an on
o Pa'fmefs lr::t in any such capacity, that person j ol b
PllfPOItmg N affence and liable in the same manne e
o Otf\i;heco(;npany or association to the penalty provi
partnership,

that offence.”.

ARTICLE 15

e 16 of the principal Law there shall

At the beginning of Articl ragraphs (1) and (1A) of

be inserted the words “Without prejudice to pa
Article 15,7,
ARTICLE 16

w, in paragraph (2), after sub-

In Article 18 of the principal La «or” and the following sub-

paragraph (c) there shall be added the word
aragraph -
p it to him at that address by telex,

i duce a
imi eans which pro
r other similar m - of the

“(d) by sending
facsimile 0O sii
document  containing the

. : »»
commumcatlon. .

ARTICLE 17

In Article 19 of the principal Law -

M M [y M n
h (2), for the words begmrlmg bel}—?ag]] zge
d e’nding “peing a company ;2;:;5 Osn b
¢ inci on in ,

i words “a principal pers | . o
s t?:;yee banker, auditor or 'legal adv1serrgi :d -
o e en;pa pem;it, any person nominated (gr apgrmit "
] h(l)(lderroeport in respect of such a holder of a p
make a

(a) in paragrap
individual”, an



38

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) ( Jersey) Law 199

(b

(c)

(d)

g

any other person who appears to be in possession of
relevant information”;

in paragraph (3) -

(i) for the words “paragraphs (1) and (2)” there shall be
substituted the words “paragraphs (1), (2) and (4B)”,

(i) for the words “any person who appears to the
Commission to be acting” there shall be substituted
the words “a former holder of a permit, to any
person who the Commission has reasonable cause to
believe has committed an offence under the
provisions of Article 9 (Misleading statements and
practices) and to any person who appears to the
Commission to be acting or to have acted”;

at the beginning of paragraph (4) there shall be inserted
the words “Subject to paragraph (4A),”;

after paragraph (4) there shall be inserted the following
paragraphs -

“(4A) A person liable to be examined under oath
under paragraph (2) is not required to disclose any
information which he is entitled to refuse to disclose on
grounds of legal professional privilege except that a

lawyer may be required to disclose the name and address
of his client,

(4B) An inspector appointed under this Article may,
at a reasonable time, having given prior written notice of
his intention to do so, and on producing if required
evidence of his authority, enter any premises occupied by
the holder of a permit or any other person referred to in
paragraph (2) or any other premises where information is

kept by such a person, for the purpose of carrying out his
duties under this Article.

Collective Investm

(e)

39

Law 199
ent Funds (Amendmenlt) (Jersey)

pOWC(IS lndel palag[aph (4B) Shall be gullty ()f an

offence.”;

g ph (6) there Shau be lnselted lhe fOl owin

hs -
paragrap -
convicted on 2 pr(')se;%‘;e
an investigation under this

ordered to pay the
may be

“(6A) A person
instituted as a result of nvestee
may in the same pro'cee. g ot 5

penses Of the investigation to
ex

:]f pal ag[ aph (6‘ ‘)x the

include such sums as
e of the cost of

(6B) For the purposes
i tigation
nses of the inves  sha o
fr):f eCommission may determine 1n Tesp
staff and overheads.

made by a person in corpphance
ed by virtue of this Amcle. may
g ence against him 1n
under

6C) A statement
. o
with a requirement 1mp
not be used by the prosecy
any criminal procegdmgg
aragraph (4C) of this Arti pareg
F()4) of Article 14 (Offences and pe

d
6C) shall be construe
o y enquiry under

tion in evid :
dings

except procee
cle or paragraph (), (2A) or

(6D) Nothing in paragra e
as preventing the use of a statem

paragraph (6).”.
ARTICLE 18

Aite] Al [lCle 19 ()f the [)IlllCl[)iﬂ I_‘aW [hele Shﬁll be inser [ed the

following Articles -



40

Collective Inve
stiment Funds (Amer
A idment) (Jerse
y) Law 199
“ARTICLE 19A

Obstruction of investigations

(1) It shall
suspects - be an offence for a person who kn
Ows or

( )
a tha[ llliOllllathll, bOOkS or papels are or

be requi i
. red under Art; are likely to
information etc.); or ricle8 - (Power 1o Obi]ain

(b i
) that an investigation is bein

carried out und g or is likel
, er i ytob
Commission), Article 19 (Investigation b;

to falsify, co
» conceal, destro
permit the falsificati y or otherwise dispo
information bl(?ocsnon’ concealment destruitiifnon ?ir o
' § or papers whic or disposal of
ich he know 0
s

would be requi

. L equired und . or sus

investigation underAnicle?rg Article 8 or relevant [Opecats
(2)

; . ¥ fen
no intention of cfence for a person t
books or papersc?:ocealmg facts disclosed boyptrt:lv? t?at he had
such informati m a person requiring or li information,
out or likely to(;)t Cbook§ or papers undergArzic;]e(eéy to require
arrying an investigation under A ([).r lCanying
rticle 19.

ARTICLE 19B

Entry and search of premises

there i ailiff is satisfi : .
ere is reasonable cause to suspljg ?g, :nformaUOn on oath that
at -

(a) if a no H
‘ tice were gi
Article 8 or paragrag ven under paragraph (5) of

h :
not be complied withp-) (4B) of Article 19 it would

41

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(b)

©

(d)

(&)

4

if any person Wwere required to produce books or
papers under paragraph (1), (2) or 3) of Article 8,
those books or papers would be likely to be
removed, tampered with or destroyed;

a specified person has failed in any respect to
comply with a notice or requirement referred to in
sub—paragraph (a) or (b);

a specified person has not provided complete
information, books or papers in response o a notice
or requirement referred to in sub-paragraph (a) or

(b);

a person authorised by the Commission has been or
may be obstructed in exercising a power under
paragraph (5) of Article 8; or

an inspector appointed under Article 19 has been or
may be obstructed in exercising a power under
paragraph (4B) of that Article,

he may grant a warrant under this paragraph.

@

A warrant under paragraph (1) may authorise any

police officer, together with any other person named in the

warrant -

(a)

(b)

to enter any premises specified in the warrant, using
such force as is reasonably necessary for the

purpose;

to search the premises and obtain information of
take possession of any books or papers appearing 10
be books or papers of a type referred to in any of the
provisions mentioned 10 paragraph (1) or
information relating to matters referred to therein or
which otherwise appeat to be relevant tO the
investigation of any offence under this Law, or to



42

Collective In
vestment Funds (A
S (Amendment) (Jers.
sey) Law 199

< N ] t n “y U(:]l l)()()k Ot l) !)els a“y
lke mn relatio to a ’
S S
a
:[l: S[EFS hl[h ”la) appeaj to te “eCeSSaI) to
plesel ve the“] or to pleve”t ”"eliele”ce Wlth [he”l
y

(c) to tak
€ copi
papers andF::,ei of'or extracts from such book
of them or aeQurre the person who had OSO s or
possession of nyl person who appears pto Sf,ssmn
- relevant i . e in
explanation of them: information to provide an

(d tor ;
€quire any
person n :
answer : amed in the
mauerin%estronp relevant for dete warrant to
connection with this Law drmrmng any
AW, an

(e) if the b
ooks or pa
pers are :
any person a . not provided, t R
information ﬁf e;I;tI;g to be in POSsession’ofO r:g:z;r(z
. , to the . n
and belief, where they are best of his knowledge

(3) A warr
force until th ant under paragraph (1
the date o e'enq of the period of on ol continue in
n which it was issued. € month beginning with

(4)  Any book
be retained oks or papers taken under
- paragraph (2) ma
Y

('1 i y
b ) fora per iod of one year; or
’

» I[hln [hat .

books or period, proceedings t .
0

any perfsrll)ers are_ relevant are commencwél ich 'the

pro . » until  the conclusi €d against

ceedings. clusion of those

5) A
. person h .
business an Who requires fi
b or the .
request the S’erscz)p]k_s or papers taken under aIiurposes of his
copies of them 1:(; whose custody they are Isetag raph (2) may
retained shall fi and the person in whose ained to furnish
urnish such copies as soon as custody they are
possible.

Collective Investment

43

Funds (Amendmerit) (Jersey

(6) Any person who he exercise of any power
der this Article or fails to comply

conferred by a warrant un
with a requirement imposed on him by virtue of sub-
paragraph (), (d) or (e) of paragraph (2) shall be guilty of an

offence.

) Law 199

obstructs t

premises books orf

m whose
y such

(7) Where any

papers are taken under paragraph (2) claims a lien on an
- books or papers, the possession of such books or papers by the

officer or person concerned and by anyone to whom he passes

them shall be without prejudice to the lien.
hall require the disclosure or
tion, books or papers which
t be entitled to refuse to
ds of legal professional
t,if heis a lawyer,

person fro

thing in this Article s
production by a person of informa
he would in an action in the Cour
disclose or produce on the groun
privilege in proceedings in the Court excep
the name and address of his client.

(8) No

(9) A statement made by a person in compliance with a
requirement imposed by virtue of this Article may not be used
by the prosecution in evidence against him in any criminal
proceedings except proceedings under paragraph (6) of this

(4) of Article 14 (Offences

Article or paragraph (1), (2A) or
and penalties).
ARTICLE 19C

Co-operation with relevant supervisory authority

the following powers

y exercise
f assisting a relevant

(1) The Commission ma
at the request of or for the purposes O
supervisory authority -
conditions on the grant of a
h (1) of Article 6 or to vary

(a) the power to impose
ch a new condition under

permit under paragrap
such conditions oOf atta

paragraph (3) of that Article;



44

Collecti
ective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(b) the power t
o refuse to grant a .
Eﬂ;agraph(l) of Article 6 or to Cafce;mlt under
nder paragraph (6) of that Article: a permit

(c) the powers under Article 8:
d .
(d) the powers of investigation under Article 19:

(e) the power to
apply for a w ,
(Entry and search of premisggém under Article 19B -~

{f) the powers i
of intervention und
. er par.
(8) of Article 20 (Applications to C(f)urt?'graphs @

(g) subjec
" cjomtnt)zn;;irz:grtapf;](Z) and Article 19H, the power
. ate to the relevant isor
1o commi : e rel supervisory a i
Com:;liastsl?n which is in the possessirgn U;?Ortl;)’
comn ion, whether or not as a result of he
se of any of the above powers e

(2) The Commissi

. mission shall .

relating to o f not communicate in i

g to participants in a collective investment fft(l)r:g]attlon
0 a

relevant superviso
ry authori
paragraph (1) unless - ority under sub-paragraph (g) of

(a) the informati .
ation s of . .
paragraph (2) ofArticlel9DZ"orklnd described in

(b) the partici
consents to its disclosure. e information relates

(3) The Lo
of this ArtiC]eC(l)lII:mlsS{on.shall not exercise powers by virt
requested by the re?ZS 1tt is satisfied that the assistance lii
vant supervisory authori
ority only for the

pUlp()SCS Of the exercise ()1 one o ore ()1 its S”])e] VIS()]y
T I

45

Collective Investment Funds (Amendmerlt) (Jersey) Law 199

to exercise its powers by virtue

(4) In deciding whether
on shall take into account, in

of this Article, the Commissi
particular -
g assistance would be given in

(a) whether correspondin
the Commission;

that country or territory to

(b) whether the case concerns the possible preach of a
law, or other requirement, which has no close
parallel in the Bailiwick or involves the assertion of

a jurisdiction not recognized by the Bailiwick;

f the case and its importance in the

(c) the seriousness o
assistance could be

Bailiwick and whether the
obtained by other means; and

is otherwise appropriate in the public

(d) whether it
give the assistance sought.

interest to
decline to exercise pOWErS
under this Article unless the relevant supervisory authority
undertakes to make such contribution towards the costs of their
exercise as the Commission considers appropriate.

(5) The Commission may

ARTICLE 19D

Restriction on disclosure of information

(1) Except as provided in paragraphs (2) and (3) and in

Articles 19E to 19G -

for the purposes of this Law

(a) no person who under or
ting to the business or other

receives information rela
affairs of any person, and

such information directly

(b) no person who obtains any
ceived it as

or indirectly from a person who has re

aforesaid,



46

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

shall disclose the information without the consent of the person
to whom it relates and (if different) the person from whom it
was received as aforesaid.

(2) This Article does not apply to information which -

(a) at the time of the disclosure, is or has already been
made available to the public from other sources; or

(b) is in the form of a summary or collection of
information so framed as not to enable information

relating to any particular person to be ascertained
from it.

(3) This Article does not apply to information which is
communicated to a relevant supervisory authority under sub-
paragraph (g) of paragraph (1) of Article 19C.

(4) Any person who discloses information in
contravention of this Article shall be guilty of an offence.

ARTICLE 19E

Disclosure facilitating discharge of functions by
Commission

(1) Article 19D does not preclude the disclosure of
information in any case in which disclosure is for the purpose
of enabling or assisting the Commission to discharge its
functions under this Law or any other enactment under which it
exercises a supervisory function,

(2) Without prejudice to the generality of paragraph (1),
Article 19D does not preclude the disclosure of information by
the Commission to the auditor of a holder of a permit, a former
holder of a permit or of a person who appears to the
Commission to be acting or to have acted in contravention of
the provisions of paragraph (1) or (2) of Article 4 (Requirement
for functionary to hqld permit), if it appears to the Commission

Collective Investment F

that disclosing the information w
Cominission
paragraph (1) or W
participants or poten
funds.

properly to discha.
Commission const
qualified per

47
unds (Amendmerir) (Jersey) Law 199

ould enable or assist the
to discharge the functions mentioned in

ould otherwise be in thg iqterests o£
tial participants in collective investmen

r to enable or assist the Commissmn
ons under this Law, the
ders it necessary to §e_ek advice frorirslear:)};
son on any matter reqmrmg1 Ctlhelhzx;r:dosure
professional skill, Article 19D does not preciude

i tion as
by the Commission to that person of such informa

hat he is
ears to the Commission to be necessary to ensglr:e\;hmh i
2li)gr)([))perly informed with respect (0 the matters

advice is sought.

If, in orde '
o rge any of its functi

ARTICLE 19F

i iscount
Disclosure facilitating discharge of functions by Visc

reclude the disclosure Dby the

C
O”HI“SSIO“ Of lnfOIIIlatl()n to the \ ISC()UIlt in conne tion Wlth
CIIlatteIS Whlcll are 1n the pIOCCSS Of be“lg deal[ Wlth [)UI Sua“[ to

the Bankruptcy (Désastre) (I ersey) Law 1990.

Article 19D does not p

ARTICLE 19G

Other permitted disclosures

(1) Article 19D does not preclude the disclosure of

information -

igation of a suspected
f or otherwise for the
, whether

(a) with a view tqntsttlietui;\(;/nes(t)
gf)f:pncf:esorotft,lealny criminal proceedings,
under this Law or not;

(b) in connection with any other proceedings arising out

of this Law;



48

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(¢) witha view to the institution of, or otherwise for the
purposes of, any disciplinary proceedings relating to
the exercise of his professional duties by -

(i) an auditor of an applicant for a permit, a holder
of a permit or a former holder of a permit, or a
person who was the auditor of a holder of a
permit or a former holder of a permit at any
time during the period the permit was held, or

(i) a person appointed to make a report under
paragraph (1A) of Article 8 (Power to obtain
information etc.), or

(iil) an inspector appointed under Article 19.

(2) Article 19D does not preclude the disclosure by the
Commission or any person acting on its behalf to the Attorney
General or a police officer of information obtained by virtue of
Article 8 or 19 or of information in the possession of the
Commission or person about any matter in relation to which the
powers conferred by those Articles are exercisable, but any
information so disclosed may only be disclosed by a police
officer for the purposes of a prosecution either in the Bailiwick
or, with the prior consent of the Attorney General, elsewhere.

(3) Atticle 19D does not preclude the disclosure by the
Commission or any person acting on its behalf to an inspector
appointed under Article 19, under Article 15 of the Company
Securities (Insider Dealing) (Jersey) Law 1988, under Article
128 of the Companies (Jersey) Law 1991 or under any other
enactment under which the Commission exercises 2
supervisory function.

(4) Subject to Article 19H, Article 19D does not
preclude the disclosure by the Commission of information to
any person or body responsible for a scheme for compensating
investors (whether {n the Bailiwick or elsewhere) if it appears

49
Collective Investment Funds (Amendmen't) (Jersey) Law 199

to the Commission that disclosing the information would
enable or assist the recipient of the information or the
Commission to discharge its functions but any such disclosure
by the Commission may only be made if -

(a) the recipient of the information has given to the
Commission a written undertaking that the
information will not be further disclosed without the
prior consent of the Commission; and

(b) where the information relates to a participant in a
collective investment fund, that person consents (0
its disclosure.

ARTICLE 19H
Attachment of conditions to disclosure

No information shall be disclosed under sub-
paragraph (g) of paragraph (1) of Article 19C or paragra.ph @
of Article 19G unless the Commission or any person acting on
its behalf is satisfied that the authority, person or body
concerned complies with or will comply with any conditions to
which the Commission of person acting on its behalf may, in
their discretion, subject such disclosure.

ARTICLE 19]

Information supplied to Commission by relevant
supervisory authority

Article 19D applies also to information supplied to the
Commission for the purposes of its functions under this Law by
a relevant supervisory authority but no such information shall
be disclosed except as provided in that Article or for the
purpose of enabling or assisting the Commission to discharge
those functions or with a view to the institution of, or otherwise
for the purposes of, criminal proceedings, whether under this
Law or otherwise.



50

Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

ARTICLE 19K

Communication by auditor and other persons with
Commission

(1) No duty to which an auditor or a person appointed to
make a report under paragraph (1A) of Article 8 (Power to
obtain information etc.) may be subject shall be regarded as
contravened by reason of his communicating in good faith to
the Commission, whether or not in response to a request made
by it, any information or opinion on a matter to which this
Article applies and which is relevant to any function of the
Commission under this Law.

(2) In relation to an auditor, this Article applies to a
matter of which he becomes aware in his capacity as such and
which relates to the business or affairs of a holder of a permit,
former holder of a permit or collective investment fund, as the
case may be, or any holding company or subsidiary in relation
to it.

(3) In relation to a person appointed to make a report
under paragraph (1A) of Article 8, this Article applies to any
matter of which he becomes aware in his capacity as the person
making the report and which relates to the business or affairs of
the holder of a permit or former holder of a permit in relation
to whom his report is made.

(4) The Committee may by Order, on the
recommendation of the Commission given after the
Commission has consulted with such persons as appear to it to
represent the interests of the persons referred to in paragraph
(1) and holders of permits, specify circumstances in which the
persons referred to in paragraph (1) shall be required to
communicate any information or opinion to the Commission on
a matter to which this Article applies, and which is relevant to
any function of the Commission under this Law.

51

Collective Investment Funds (Amendn’enr) (Jersey) Law 199

(5) A person who fails to comply with an Order made
under paragraph (4) shall be guilty of an offence and liable to a
fine or to imprisonment for a term not exceeding six months or
to both such fine and such imprisonment.

(6) In this Article, ‘auditor’ means an auditor of a holder
of a permit, a former holder of a permit or a collective
investment fund and includes a person who was the auditor of a
holder of a permit or former holder of a permit at any time
during the period the permit was held.

ARTICLE 19L
Register of holders of permits

(1) The Commission shall keep a register of persons to
whom permits have been granted.

(2) The register referred to in paragraph (1) sha.ll be in
such form and contain such particulars as the Commission may
from time to time determine.

(3) The register referred to in paragraph (1) shall be
kept in such place as the Commission may determine, and any

person shall be permitted to inspect the register during ordinary
office hours, and to take copies of any entry in it.”.

ARTICLE 19

In Article 20 of the principal Law, after paragraph (2) there

shall be inserted the following paragraphs -

“(2A) Where an order is made under paragraph (1), the
variation, new condition or revocation to which it relates shall
take immediate effect but any person aggrieved by such order
may apply to the court, either in term time or vacation, to vary
or set aside the order on the ground that the order was
unreasonable having regard to all the circumstances of the case.



52
Collective Investment Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199

(2B) On an application under paragraph (2A), the court
may make such order as it thinks fit.”"

ARTICLE 20

After Article 22 of the principal Law there shall be inserted the
following Article -

“ARTICLE 22A
Fees

Fees prescribed under this Law shall be payable to the
Commission.”,

ARTICLE 21

(1) This Law may be cited as the Collective Investment
Funds (Amendment) (Jersey) Law 199 .

(2) This Law shall come into force on such day or days as the
States may by Act appoint and different days may be appointed for the
coming into force of different provisions and for different purposes.



